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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: PO2200060341
2 messages

Garry Keith <garry.keith@eswl-ltd.com> 28 December 2023 at 16:15
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

That would help wouldn’t it Kate.

 

Sorry about that, please see attached…

 

Kind Regards

Garry

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 28 December 2023 16:08
To: Garry Keith <garry.keith@eswl-ltd.com>
Subject: Re: PO2200060341

 

Good afternoon Garry,

 

Please could you send me the attachment?

 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will
be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or
call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Thu, 28 Dec 2023 at 16:05, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Garry Keith <garry.keith@eswl-ltd.com>
Date: Thu, 28 Dec 2023 at 16:04
Subject: PO2200060341
To: office@viamed.co.uk <office@viamed.co.uk>

 

 

 

Hello,

 

Please find attached PO2200060341 which you quoted to my colleague Vickie Mathieson in November. 

 

Please confirm receipt of this order and note the following points.

Please ensure our PO number is listed on any delivery paperwork, including items that come direct from manufacturers or third
parties.
Please advise country of origin and HS code for the materials that are supplied on this order on your delivery note.
Please advise the expected delivery date for this order and unless agreed in advance please deliver all goods as one complete
order.
If ESWL do not currently have credit account facilities set up with your company please send relevant account forms so that we can
establish credit terms.
If you are shipping these goods by UPS/ DHL/ TNT/ Fedex please advise them of the correct account number for import duties and
VAT to be charged to, these accounts must only be used for Duty and VAT purposes and not for shipping the goods.

UPS 8982RR
DHL 957382211
TNT 1612580
Fedex 387423796

 

If you have any queries please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind Regards

Garry
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2200060341.pdf
69K

Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 29 December 2023 at 08:51
Draft To: Garry Keith <garry.keith@eswl-ltd.com>

Thank you Garry, 

The lead time would be 8-10 weeks for this item - we are waiting for the sensor it needs.

I also need to inform you that since my reply to Vicki in November, this item has now been discontinued (after you have purchased the last
one).

The alternatives for future reference are as follows:

0111274 - MaxN2 AE Nitrogen analyzer.  These cost £430 each, plus £12 carriage, plus VAT.
0111273 -  MaxN2 A Nitrogen analyzer.  These cost £430 each, plus £12 carriage, plus VAT.
0111248 - Handi+ N2 Nitrogen analyzer with integral sensor.  These cost £250 each, plus £12 carriage, plus VAT.

Though of course I am unable to guarantee the pricing will remain the same.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office
will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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