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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Re: New customer message on 26 November 2023 at 8:29 am
1 message

Lester Kwok - Orpheus Dive <godiving@orpheusdive.com> 27 December 2023 at 06:49
Reply-To: Lester Kwok - Orpheus Dive <godiving@orpheusdive.com>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan,

Sorry, can you also add on
0120130 x 1 unit
0120131 x 1 unit
0120120 x 1 unit

For us to serve you better, please send us a message using this link https://od.sg/wa
Best Regards Lester Kwok

Lester Kwok 
PADI Master Instructor | PADI TecRec Deep Instructor
--
2020 Dive Shop Operating Hours
Monday : By Appointments Only
Tuesday to Friday : 12pm to 8pm
Weekends, Eve of Public Holidays and Public Holidays : 10am to 6pm
--
PADI Courses - http://www.orpheusdive.com/scuba-diving-courses/
--
Namaste | ओं मणिपद्मे हूं, | Ahisma | अहिंसा 
Be Kind & Compassionate To All Living Beings & Creatures, this is the only religion

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
PADI 5 Star Dive Centre | TecRec Centre
PADI Courses > Dive Travel > Equipment Sales, Servicing and Rental
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
All travel arrangements, accommodation, right of passage on any conveyance, transfers, land sea and air
ticketing, are made by Eurydice Travel Pte Ltd (Partner Company of Orpheus Dive), TA 03053.

Please note that all dive centres in Singapore are required by law to be registered with Singapore
Tourism Board. Failure to do so is an offense and divers might have problems with their insurance
claims should anything happen.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
Address : 16 Zion Road Singapore 247733
Landline : +65 6887 3631
What's App : +65 8030 6522
Email : godiving@orpheusdive.com
Website : www.orpheusdive.com
Website : www.eurydicetravel.com
Facebook : www.facebook.com/orpheusdive
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
This is an official email from Orpheus Dive Private Limited and is protected by a disclaimer.

On Wed, 27 Dec at 2:41 PM , Lester Kwok - Orpheus Dive <godiving@orpheusdive.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,

Can I place in the following orders please?

7910100 x 1 unit

https://od.sg/wa
http://www.orpheusdive.com/scuba-diving-courses/
mailto:godiving@orpheusdive.com
http://www.orpheusdive.com/
http://www.eurydicetravel.com/
https://www.facebook.com/orpheusdive
mailto:godiving@orpheusdive.com
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7910111 x 2 units
110217 x 2 units
110224 x 2units

Let us know if we can pay by credit card.

Best Regards Lester Kwok

Lester Kwok 
PADI Master Instructor | PADI TecRec Deep Instructor
--
2020 Dive Shop Operating Hours
Monday : By Appointments Only
Tuesday to Friday : 12pm to 8pm
Weekends, Eve of Public Holidays and Public Holidays : 10am to 6pm
--
PADI Courses - http://www.orpheusdive.com/scuba-diving-courses/
--
Namaste | ओं मणिपद्मे हूं, | Ahisma | अहिंसा 
Be Kind & Compassionate To All Living Beings & Creatures, this is the only religion

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
PADI 5 Star Dive Centre | TecRec Centre
PADI Courses > Dive Travel > Equipment Sales, Servicing and Rental
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
All travel arrangements, accommodation, right of passage on any conveyance, transfers, land
sea and air ticketing, are made by Eurydice Travel Pte Ltd (Partner Company of Orpheus Dive),
TA 03053.

Please note that all dive centres in Singapore are required by law to be registered with
Singapore Tourism Board. Failure to do so is an offense and divers might have problems
with their insurance claims should anything happen.
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .
Address : 16 Zion Road Singapore 247733
Landline : +65 6887 3631
What's App : +65 8030 6522
Email : godiving@orpheusdive.com
Website : www.orpheusdive.com
Website : www.eurydicetravel.com
Facebook : www.facebook.com/orpheusdive
. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 
This is an official email from Orpheus Dive Private Limited and is protected by a disclaimer.

On Mon, 27 Nov at 8:18 PM , Ryan. swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Lester

Thank you for your message.

We would be happy to supply you on a trade basis. Please find attached our trade prices
and some product information.

With regards to analysers, for individual divers our TEK-OX has proved to be the most
popular model. I would recommend the auto off version, as it eliminates the risk of leaving
it on in the box and depleting the batteries before the next time you need to use it. Also flat
batteries can have a tendency to leak and cause more trouble.

Both our VN202 and TEK-OX have a 5 year warranty against manufacturing faults, this
excludes the sensor, batteries and cable where applicable.

The sensors have a 12 month warranty, but typically last 2+ years in normal use, some
have been known to last up to 4 years.

Please note that we do not impose any minimum order quantities, but we would ask that

http://www.orpheusdive.com/scuba-diving-courses/
mailto:godiving@orpheusdive.com
http://www.orpheusdive.com/
http://www.eurydicetravel.com/
https://www.facebook.com/orpheusdive
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
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your orders are prepaid by either bank transfer or credit card, at least until we built up
some trading history. If you would like to place an order, please can you send me your
invoice and delivery address. We would also need the contact number and email address
for your accounts, purchasing and owners of the company.

I look forward to your feedback and please let me know if you have any questions.

Kind regards
Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Sun, 26 Nov 2023 at 08:29, Vandagraph (Shopify) <mailer@shopify.com> wrote:

You received a new message from your online store's contact form.

Country Code:
SG

Name:
LESTER KWOK

Email:
godiving@orpheusdive.com

Phone Number:
93757122

Message:
Could we know what are the requirements and MOQ needed to sell
the analyzers here in Singapore and Bali?

ORPHEUS DIVE powered by Freshdesk 

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:mailer@shopify.com
mailto:godiving@orpheusdive.com
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