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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Photo from Airtek Technologies
1 message

Airtek Technologies <airtektechnologies@gmail.com> 27 December 2023 at 10:24
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Thank you Ryan, I need one. Please send me proforma invoice with delivery cost included.
My address is : Airtek air technologies
C/ Josep Pallach 11A 
Esclanyá 17213 Girona Spain
Contact: Claudio 640117391
Have a nice day

On Wed, 27 Dec 2023, 10:55 Ryan Swaine, <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning

Thank you for your email. The sensor you require is our R-33DE, we have them available from stock at a trade
price of GBP £40 each EXW

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 27 Dec 2023 at 09:35, Airtek Technologies <airtektechnologies@gmail.com> wrote:
Good morning sirs, i would like to know if you have one sensor compatible with the sensor i send you in the
picture. Thank you, have a nice and happy new year
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