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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Please send me an invoice for payment of oxygen sensors

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Megant LLC <megant.llc@gmail.com>

Date: Wed, 27 Dec 2023 at 08:11

Subject: Please send me an invoice for payment of oxygen sensors
To: <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, <Katie.Evans@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Zoey and Katie,

| hope you feel good and you are healthy.

Please send me an invoice for payment for your products, namely:
1) 2 x R-49V oxygen sensors (Part number 0110049);

2) 1 x R-24MED oxygen sensor (Part number 0110024);

3) 1 x T-7V oxygen sensor (Part number 0110058).

| will pay this invoice as quickly as | receive it from you.

27 December 2023 at 09:06

After my payment to you please shipped my order to the address in the UK to which you have already shipped the

previous orders, namely:

Delivery Address:

Oleksandr Pavliuk

Brother Parcel Post NP0O00527778
Unit10, PhoenixPark, Parkwood
(Nova Poshta International)
Maidstone

ME15 9XN

Kent

+447926258649

| will provide you with an international waybill that confirms the export of your products outside the UK (for VAT reporting
on your part), as soon as it is sent to me by the manager of the transport company Nova Poshta International.

Thank you very much in advance!

Kindest Regards,

Oleksandr Pavliuk

Director

MEGANT LLC

tel. +38 (096) 701-68-28

e-mail: megant.llc@gmail.com

website: https://www.megant.com.ua/
Telegram: https://t. me/MEGANT_LLC_bot
Kyiv, Ukraine

Please consider the environment before printing this email
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