12/13/23, 4:13 PM Gmail - Fwd: Please drop me a proforma for 1 ea MAX02+AE Oxygen Monitor #0111261

M G ma|l Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Please drop me a proforma for 1 ea MAX02+AE Oxygen Monitor #0111261

2 messages

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 13 December 2023 at 16:11

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Gerold Diessenbacher, MediTrade GmbH <gd@meditrade.org>

Date: Wed, 13 Dec 2023 at 16:08

Subject: WG: Please drop me a proforma for 1 ea MAX02+AE Oxygen Monitor #0111261
To: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>

Good afternoon Kate,

Thank you for the quote. Hm — currency is not stated in the quote? Is it in Euros? And wasn’t there not yet made a

note to our account that insurance is generally covered by us? We have a global insurance covering all our
worldwide im-/exports?

No need that you drop me an updated quote. Just confirm currency and that insurance will not be billed.

Thank you so much.

Kind Regards,
Gerold Diessenbacher

MediTrade-Oyten

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Kate Griffiths
Gesendet: Mittwoch, 13. Dezember 2023 16:32

An: Gerold Diessenbacher, MediTrade GmbH <gd@meditrade.org>

Betreff: Re: Please drop me a proforma for 1 ea MAX02+AE Oxygen Monitor #0111261

Good afternoon Gerold,

Thank you for your order.

Please see attached proforma invoice, valid for 30 days.

Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1785092983349651636% 7Cmsg-f:178518376080836...
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