12/13/23, 10:13 AM Gmail - RE: FW: Quote request

M G ma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: FW: Quote request

1 message

Jager, Gijsbert de <gijsbert.de.jager@mediq.com> 12 December 2023 at 15:31
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Adresses are correct.

Invoice pdf by mail to: invoice@medig.com

Met vriendelijke groet,

Gijsbert de Jager, Teamleider Technische Service

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Kate Griffiths
Verzonden: dinsdag 12 december 2023 16:26

Aan: Jager, Gijsbert de <gijsbert.de.jager@mediq.com>

Onderwerp: Re: FW: Quote request

Thank you Gijsbert,
It will be tomorrow that | send the proforma invoice as | have to wait for a colleague for the UPS charge.

In the meantime, the addresses | have used are as follows:

Delivery Address Invoice Address

Mediq Nederland BV Mediq Nederland BV

Costcenter 301254 Technical Services Costcenter 301254 Technical Services
Rijnzathe 10 Rijnzathe 10

De Meern De Meern

3454 PV 3454 PV

Netherlands Netherlands

Are these correct please?

Many thanks.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 12 Dec 2023 at 14:06, Jager, Gijsbert de <gijsbert.de.jager@mediq.com> wrote:

Good afternoon Kate,

UPS shipping is ok.

Yes please can you send me a proforma for 8x 1410000 - V1000

Thanks!

Met vriendelijke groet,

Gijsbert de Jager, Teamleider Technische Service
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Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Kate Griffiths
Verzonden: maandag 11 december 2023 17:21

Aan: Jager, Gijsbert de <gijsbert.de.jager@mediq.com>

Onderwerp: Re: FW: Quote request

Good afternoon Gijsbert,

Thank you for your reply.

The price of part number 1410000 - V1000 is €514.10 each EXW.

The production time is approximately 2-3 weeks (please also take into account possible Christmas delays).

Please let me know if you would like a proforma invoice detailing carriage charge and insurance. We use UPS as
our courier, but of course you could arrange your own shipping (EXW).

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 11 Dec 2023 at 09:07, Jager, Gijsbert de <gijsbert.de.jager@mediq.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

We can do business directly as you can read in the email.
So would you please send me a quote for:

8x V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator

Mediq Nederland BV

Costcenter 301254 Technical Services
Rijnzathe 10

3454 PV DE MEERN

Netherlands

Invoice: in PDF please to invoice@medig.com

Delivery address we will send you when we order..

Thank you in advance.

Attached: Mediq Purchase Conditions

Kind regards,

Met vriendelijke groet,

Gijsbert de Jager, Teamleider Technische Service

Van: Ismayilova, Farida <farida.ismayilova@mediq.com>

Verzonden: zondag 10 december 2023 21:14

Aan: Jager, Gijsbert de <gijsbert.de.jager@mediq.com>; Collé, Daniélle <danielle.colle@mediqg.com>
CC: Meijer, Erik <erik.meijer@medig.com>

Onderwerp: RE: Quote request
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Hi Gijsbert

Below .... annual spend, you can arrange directly with supplier under mediq TCs.

Best Regards,

Farida Ismayilova

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Kate Griffiths
Verzonden: maandag 4 december 2023 14:28

Aan: Jager, Gijsbert de <gijsbert.de.jager@mediq.com>

Onderwerp: Re: Quote request

External sender: Please do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
source.

Good afternoon Gijsbert,

Thank you for your enquiry.

Please could | ask if you are working for Mediq Suomi Oy? | can then assist you further as the
V1000 are now available.

If you let me know your delivery and invoice addresses, | can see which account to use on our
system or create a new account.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 4 Dec 2023 at 11:57, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jager, Gijsbert de <gijsbert.de.jager@mediq.com>
Date: Mon, 4 Dec 2023 at 11:52

Subject: Quote request

To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

Good afternoon,

Can you send me a price/offer for 8x V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator?

And is it available now?

Company:
Mediq Nederland BV

Team Technical Services

Kind Regards,

Met vriendelijke groet,

Gijsbert de Jager, Teamleider Technische Service
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