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Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: New Purchase Order po-12306965 (4 drops of 25 cells in January 2024)
Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 4 December 2023 at 16:36
Reply-To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com
To: office@vmsecure.me.uk

Please process the VST order from JFD (Scotland) for 8010050 oxygen sensors.

Set shipment dates as:
22/01
29/01
05/02
12/02

Steve

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Duncan Clark <D.Clark@jfdglobal.com>
Date: Mon, 4 Dec 2023 at 16:17
Subject: RE: New Purchase Order po-12306965 (4 drops of 25 cells in January 2024)
To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com <steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com>

Hiu Steve,

 

Please see amended order with the correct cost £65.00 each. The preference would be to start deliveries w/c 15th Jan 2024, so please accelerate the order.

 

Best regards
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Duncan Clark Purchasing Manager
D.Clark@jfdglobal.com  
 
JFD
Office: +44 (0)1224 740145 Fax: +44 (0)1224 740172
 
Enterprise Drive, Westhill, AB32 6TQ
United Kingdom
jfdglobal.com
 

 

Follow us on: 
 

           

 
 
 

 

 

JFD is the trading name of JFD Ltd. Registered in Scotland, No: SC123684 with Registered office: JFD, Westhill Industrial Estate, Enterprise Drive, Westhill, Aberdeen, AB326TQ, United Kingdom 

This email and any attachments are confidential and may contain proprietary information, some of which may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to which it is addressed. If you are 
not the intended recipient, please notify the author immediately by replying to this email, and then delete all copies of the e‑mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you must not use, disclose, distribute, 
copy, print or rely on this email.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Steve Nixon
Sent: Monday, December 4, 2023 3:43 PM
To: Duncan Clark <D.Clark@jfdglobal.com>
Subject: Re: New Purchase Order po-12306965 (4 drops of 25 cells in January 2024)

 

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is
safe

Hi Duncan

 

As discussed during the meeting you said that you wanted separate production batches, so the price will be £65.00 each. I did query this again in my last email.
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As also discussed, the timetable was already tight, we cannot meet the timetable as per the purchase order. I'll confirm later, but we are probably scheduling for around the
22nd January.

 

Do you have any news on when the last invoice (RST145237-1 29th September) will be paid?

 

 

Regards

 

Steve

 

 

 

On Mon, 4 Dec 2023 at 14:36, Duncan Clark <D.Clark@jfdglobal.com> wrote:

Hi Steve,

Please see our new purchase order attached placed on JFD T&C’s also attached. Please send your acknowledgement to purchaseordersUK1@jfdglobal.com confirming
price and delivery.

Best regards

 

 

--

 

 

Steve

 

 

mailto:D.Clark@jfdglobal.com
mailto:D.Clark@jfdglobal.com
mailto:D.Clark@jfdglobal.com
mailto:purchaseordersUK1@jfdglobal.com
mailto:purchaseordersUK1@jfdglobal.com
mailto:purchaseordersUK1@jfdglobal.com
mailto:purchaseordersUK1@jfdglobal.com
mailto:purchaseordersUK1@jfdglobal.com


05/12/2023, 08:48 Gmail - Fwd: New Purchase Order po-12306965 (4 drops of 25 cells in January 2024)

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1784370505959663769&simpl=msg-f:1784370505959663769&mb=1 4/4

Steve Nixon

Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

 

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

--
 
 
Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

2 attachments

po-12306965-R0.pdf
178K

JFDG-LEG-TC-001 JFD Standard Terms and Conditions of Purchase Rev03 revi....pdf
290K
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