04/12/2023, 11:07 Gmail - Fwd: Quote request O2 Sensor 6 x R-22Vi

M Gma" Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Quote request O2 Sensor 6 x R-22Vi

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 4 December 2023 at 11:03
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Agib Majeed <aqgib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we send a proforma invoice to Georgian.
Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <office@primelab.at>

Date: Mon, 4 Dec 2023 at 10:59

Subject: AW: Quote request O2 Sensor 6 x R-22Vi

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>
Cc: Ai Watanabe Riebl <invoice@primelab.at>

Dear Ryan,

Yes please, send us de PI.
Kind regards

Dipl. -Ing. Georgian Francisco Ciolacu

Technical Engineering

Primelab GmbH

Office & Warehouse: Iglaseegasse 30-32, 1190 Vienna, Austria
Workshop: Weisses Kreuz StralRe 3, 2103 Langenzersdorf

Mobile: +43 676 3509218 Phone.: +43 1 4162938-11, Fax: EXT-20

Email: george@primelab.at Web: www.primelab.at

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f: 17843489866 14254116 &simpl=msg-f: 17843489866 14... 1/6
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Primelab Handel und Service GmbH, VAT No.: ATU 73631929

Company Registration No.: FN 495550a, Commercial Court Vienna Austria.

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine
Gesendet: Montag, 4. Dezember 2023 11:03

An: office@primelab.at

Betreff: Re: Quote request O2 Sensor 6 x R-22Vi

Dear Georgian

Thank you very much for your email.

R-22Vi - 0110020 = EUR €30.20 each EXW.

Please let me know if you would like us to provide you with a proforma invoice.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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On Mon, 4 Dec 2023 at 09:52, <office@primelab.at> wrote:

Dear Ryan,
Could you please send me an Offer for 6 x R-22Vi - pn: 01100207?

Thank you
Kind regards

Dipl. -Ing. Georgian Francisco Ciolacu

Technical Engineering

Primelab GmbH

Office & Warehouse: Iglaseegasse 30-32, 1190 Vienna, Austria
Workshop: Weisses Kreuz Stral3e 3, 2103 Langenzersdorf

Mobile: +43 676 3509218 Phone.: +43 1 4162938-11, Fax: EXT-20

Email: george@primelab.at Web: www.primelab.at
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Primelab Handel und Service GmbH, VAT No.: ATU 73631929

Company Registration No.: FN 495550a, Commercial Court Vienna Austria.

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Ryan Swaine
Gesendet: Montag, 5. Dezember 2022 12:18

An: office@primelab.at

Betreff: Re: Quote request O2 Sensor MU13223 Draeger or compatible

Dear Georgian

Thank you very much for your email.
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We would be happy to supply you with our R-22Vi sensors, which are compatible with the Draeger MU13223.
Please find our distributor pricing below:

R-22Vi - pn: 0110020 = EUR €30.20 each EXW

Sometimes Draeger supply the MU13223 sensors as a matched pair with the part number MU24903:
R-22Vi (matched pair) - pn: 0110072 = EUR €60.40 / pair EXW

We have the sensors available from stock from our UK warehouse. Please let me know if the sensor pricing is okay
and then we can send you an official quotation with shipping costs?

I look forward to your reply and any questions you may have.

Kind regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <office@primelab.at>

Date: Mon, 5 Dec 2022 at 10:58

Subject: Quote request O2 Sensor MU13223 Draeger or compatible

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>, <info@viamed-eu.com>, <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Primelab <office@primelab.at>

Dear Sir,

| would like to request a quote for:

6 x O2 Sensor Draeger MU13223(Item#: Dra-MU13223) or similar/compatible.

Delivery to Vienna, Austria.
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Please send us an Offer including shipping costs.

Thank you

Kind regards

Dipl. -Ing. Georgian Francisco Ciolacu

Technical Engineering

Primelab GmbH

Office & Warehouse: Iglaseegasse 30-32, 1190 Vienna, Austria
Workshop: Weisses Kreuz Stral3e 3, 2103 Langenzersdorf

Mobile: +43 676 3509218 Phone.: +43 1 4162938-11, Fax: EXT-20

Email: george@primelab.at Web: www.primelab.at
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Primelab Handel und Service GmbH, VAT No.: ATU 73631929

Company Registration No.: FN 495550a, Commercial Court Vienna Austria.

Steve

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.

Office: +44 (0)1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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