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Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Portable oxygen analyzer
Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 28 November 2023 at 09:18
To: Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Date: Tue, 28 Nov 2023 at 07:29
Subject: RE: Portable oxygen analyzer
To: Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: <saad.karam@alnafath.com>

Hi Janine,

Kindly be informed that we did the transfer as requested via PayPal to your account as shown in attachment.

 

 

Please confirm receipt & dispatch the goods as agreed

 

 

Hope to hear from you shortly   

 

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Thursday, 23 November, 2023 3:11 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Good Morning,

 

Yes, you can pay via PayPal from your sister company and we can send it to Baghdad.

 

If you pay in UD Dollars as per the proforma - see attached.

 

Once we receive payment we will then dispatch your goods via UPS.

 

If you would like to arrange your own courier then please let us know.

 

Please contact us if you need any other info.
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Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------
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On Thu, 23 Nov 2023 at 11:42, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Hi Janine,

 

 

Please confirm if you can accept payment via PayPal through our sister company in Amman-Jordan while keeping all documents in our company name & shipment to our
office in Iraq- Baghdad

 

 

 

Hope to hear from you shortly    

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi
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From: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 November, 2023 3:19 PM
To: 'Janine Gill' <office@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: 'Saad Karam' <saad.karam@alnafath.com>
Subject: RE: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Hi Janine,

 

 

We must pay through Bank swift to be shown in our company bank account.

 

 

I will seek another way and come back to you. In the mean time please check from your side if bank transfer is acceptable

 

 

Hope to hear from you shortly     

 

 

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi

 

mailto:khalid.natiq@alnafath.com
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:saad.karam@alnafath.com


28/11/2023, 09:48 Gmail - Fwd: Portable oxygen analyzer

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1783798862707390273&simpl=msg-f:1783798862707390273&mb=1 6/46

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Wednesday, 22 November, 2023 1:48 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Good Morning,

 

Thank you for your email.

 

I can process a proforma for you but you will need to pay via PayPal.

 

Can you confirm this will be possible?

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator
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Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 22 Nov 2023 at 06:43, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Hello Janine,
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I hope you are doing well, it was long time since we heard from each other  

 

 

 

Kindly revise the attached offer to include Qty.4 oxygen analyzer with same conditions & exact supply parts.

 

 

Hope to hear from you shortly

 

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Monday, 20 February, 2023 2:18 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Hello Khalid, 

 

Please find the signed proforma attached.

 

My colleague has advised me the item will be available mid March.

 

Once we have received payment I can reserve two on the system for you, so as soon as they are available they will be dispatched.

 

I have also attached the instruction manual.

 

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 17 Feb 2023 at 07:21, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Hi Janine,

 

Kindly proceed with invoice signature & follow the lead time issue to arrange my schedule.    

 

 

In the meantime please send me the user manual of required analyzer & sensor
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Hope to hear from you shortly  

 

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Thursday, 16 February, 2023 4:35 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Hello Khalid,

 

Regarding COO, one from UK with your company name on it is more than enough, so please add it to the invoice & send it to me   - Please see attached.
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Please be patient with me, as it is new item for us and we need to check every thing at least for this time

 

Does the analyzer come with calibration certificate? If yes what is the validity for it?, if no can we get it ?  They do not come with a certificate as the equipment are user
calibrated each time they are used.

 

Please check the proforma and let me know if all is correct or if anything needs changing. We can sign and stamp it if you are happy to proceed.

 

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Thu, 16 Feb 2023 at 13:09, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Hello again,

 

 

Regarding COO, one from UK with your company name on it is more than enough, so please add it to the invoice & send it to me  

 

 

Please be patient with me, as it is new item for us and we need to check every thing at least for this time

 

Does the analyzer come with calibration certificate? If yes what is the validity for it?, if no can we get it ?   

 

Hope to hear from you shortly

 

 

 

Best regards

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:khalid.natiq@alnafath.com


28/11/2023, 09:48 Gmail - Fwd: Portable oxygen analyzer

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1783798862707390273&simpl=msg-f:1783798862707390273&mb=1 14/46

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Thursday, 16 February, 2023 3:40 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

 

Hello Khalid,

 

 

Regarding your attached offer, does it include the certificate of origin? If not please include it   - It does not include the certificate of origin if you just need a UK one
that would cost $80 if you need one for a different country we would have to get a price for you, I do know it will be more than $80.

 

 

If included then your offer is approved,  please send to me signed and stamped invoice to proceed with payment. Once we have the proforma correct and all items
on we can sign and stamp it for you.
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One last thing, during next week payment will be done, assuming so what is lead time for the delivery. I am just waiting for my colleague to get back to me with a
lead time. As soon as I know I will let you know.

 

 

Note: this order done in order to test the analyzer, once approved by our customers we will purchase several batches.

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

-----------------

 

 

On Thu, 16 Feb 2023 at 09:10, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Hi Janine,

 

Regarding your attached offer, does it include the certificate of origin? If not please include it  

 

 

If included then your offer is approved,  please send to me signed and stamped invoice to proceed with payment

 

 

One last thing, during next week payment will be done, assuming so what is lead time for the delivery.

 

 

Note: this order done in order to test the analyzer, once approved by our customers we will purchase several batches.

 

 

Hope to hear from you shortly   
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Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Tuesday, 14 February, 2023 1:13 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Hello Khalid,

 

Please find the quote/proforma attached as requested.

 

If you need anything changing, please let me know, eg names, addresses.
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Please be aware we will need full payment before any items will be dispatched, once we have received payment we will check stock and inform you of a lead
time.

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 13 Feb 2023 at 14:26, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Janine,

 

 

I prefer to use USD for payment, regarding transport you can use UPS no problem as long as you can supply tracking # when done for me to follow from my
side

 

 

Hope to hear from you shortly

 

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Monday, 13 February, 2023 4:44 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Hi Khaild,

 

Can I ask if you will want to pay in British £'s or in USD $

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
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-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 13 Feb 2023 at 13:34, Janine Gill <janine.gill@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Khalid,

 

Yes of course sorry, I did read it wrong.

I will do the quote for you and email it over.
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We only use UPS but you can arrange an EXW courier to collect from us if you wish.

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
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-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 13 Feb 2023 at 13:26, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Janine,

 

 

Your need to check your eyes😉😉, I’m from IRAQ Not Iran  

 

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Monday, 13 February, 2023 4:11 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Hello, 

 

Just to inform you we can not deliver or invoice to Iran due to sanctions. 

 

I have just noticed this on your address, sorry for not noticing earlier.

 

If you have a company outside of Iran we may be able to deliver there.

 

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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E-mail Disclaimer
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may
be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 13 Feb 2023 at 12:39, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Dear All,

 

 

You are kindly requested to provide us with official quotation to supply Qty. 2 OxiQuant S (Part number – 0111275) with all accessories, price should
include transport to Baghdad / Iraq via express courier (TNT, DHL, FedEx etc.)

 

 

 

Hope to hear from you shortly.    

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:khalid.natiq@alnafath.com


28/11/2023, 09:48 Gmail - Fwd: Portable oxygen analyzer

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1783798862707390273&simpl=msg-f:1783798862707390273&mb=1 26/46

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Monday, 13 February, 2023 2:00 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Hi Khalid,

 

The information on the leaflet is as follows:

 

 

  Operational pressure range 750 - 1250 hPa  
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Please feel free to contact me if you need any other info. I can always pass you on to our tech team.

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 13 Feb 2023 at 10:41, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

This is great, one additional question please

 

 

What is measuring range for the OxiQuant S ??

 

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Monday, 13 February, 2023 1:07 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Hello Khalid,

Thank you for your email, sorry for the late reply I wasn't in the office last week.

The OxiQuant S Price:
Part number - 0111275.
$190 Each plus carriage. 
This includes the accessories.

  0110660 - Oxygen sensor OOI103

 

1 = $ 111.00 each 2 = $ 99.90 each 3 - 10 = $ 94.35 each 11or more = $ 88.80 each

Please send any orders to orders@viamed.co.uk.

Kind regards

Janine Gill
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Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634 542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582
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Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582
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On Wed, 8 Feb 2023 at 09:35, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Dear All,

 

 

You are kindly requested to provide us with your best commercial offer to supply the following oxygen analyzers (Qty.1 OxiQuant S + Qty.1
 Handi+) with standard accessories as mentioned in attached data sheet.  

 

 

In addition we need to know the cost of (OOI103 Oxygen Sensor) for future replacement consideration.  
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Hope to hear from you shortly

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Thursday, 2 February, 2023 6:28 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Hello Khaild,

 

Unfortunately, the Teledyne AX300 and MX300  units have been discontinued.

 

If you do want an official quote on any other items please email orders@viamed.co.uk.

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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On Thu, 2 Feb 2023 at 13:09, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Janine,
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To tell the truth the price for the analyzer is way more than my expectation. Can you please inform which type is compatible with R-17MED  and
what is the price for it.   

 

 

I believe, Teledyne AX300-I analyzer is compatible , can you supply it?   

 

 

Hope to hear from you shortly

 

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Thursday, 2 February, 2023 3:28 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Hello Khalid,

 

Sorry for the confusion.

 

I have spoken with my colleague Steve Nixon and he suggests:
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Part number 0111261 - MaxO2+AE Oxygen analyser - $5421.75 Each

 

Part number 0110429 -  Oxygen sensor MAX-250E  - $70.70 Each

 

Plus Carriage

 

The R-17MED is not compatible with this analyser.

 

If you would like an official quote please email orders@Viamed.co.uk

 

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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On Thu, 2 Feb 2023 at 11:59, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Sorry for my poor language,

 

 

Of course it will measure oxygen gas which comes for evaporated liquid oxygen, I meant the source is liquid oxygen which is known for high
purity 99.5% as most of analyzers measures up to 96% which is not enough to evaluate liquid source ( in gas phase). 😉😉

 

 

I hope it is clear now

 

 

In case you have any question please inform me  
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Hope to hear from you shortly     

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Thursday, 2 February, 2023 2:30 PM
To: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Hello Khalid,

 

Unfortunately, we do not supply those types of Oxygen analysers.

 

It reads 0 - 100% oxygen gas, sorry it will not measure and is not suitable for use with liquid.

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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On Thu, 2 Feb 2023 at 10:30, Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com> wrote:

Dear Janine,

 

 

Thanks for prompt reply, the application is for spot readings

mailto:janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
mailto:janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:khalid.natiq@alnafath.com


28/11/2023, 09:48 Gmail - Fwd: Portable oxygen analyzer

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:1783798862707390273&simpl=msg-f:1783798862707390273&mb=1 39/46

 

 

The best solution for us is ( MaxO2+AE) Oxygen analyser (preferably with R-17MED sensor) noting that it should cover 100% reading
range so it can be used with liquid oxygen source, other wise you are free to chose the best selection as long as it will be suitable for
medical use  

 

 

Regarding spare sensor, of course you are right but at least infom the price so we can estimate cost of future replcement.

 

 

Hope to hear from you shortly    

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Janine Gill
Sent: Thursday, 2 February, 2023 1:02 PM
To: khalid.natiq@alnafath.com
Subject: Re: Portable oxygen analyzer

 

Good Morning,

 

Please find the info below as requested.

 

Do you require a unit for continual monitoring or for taking spot readings?
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We can offer:

0111275  Oxygen analyser OxiQuant S.  Internal sensor can be replaced when exhausted.  For non-medical applications.

0111250  Handi+ Oxygen analyser with integral sensor.  Once the sensor has been exhausted the whole unit can be disposed of. For
medical and non medical applications.

 

0111260 MaxO2+A Oxygen analyser. Internal sensor can be replaced when exhausted. For medical and non medical applications.

 

 

For a unit with the sensor on an extension lead then we can offer.

0111261 MaxO2+A Oxygen analyser. External sensor can be replaced when exhausted. For medical and non medical applications.

 

The above are just analyzers, we can also offer oxygen monitors that have alarms.

 

We would not usually advocate buying spare sensors now as the ones in the units will typically last say 1 -3 years.

 

 

Kind regards

 

Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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On Thu, 2 Feb 2023 at 09:46, Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Janine

 

They do not mention a sensor cable, so it looks like their requirement is for direct connection to the analyzer. Going by their company
name they could well need for industrial rather than medical applications.
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I would ask them if they require a unit for continual monitoring or for taking spot readings.

 

We can offer:

0111275  Oxygen analyser OxiQuant S.  Internal sensor can be replaced when exhausted.  For non-medical applications.

0111250  Handi+ Oxygen analyser with integral sensor.  Once the sensor has been exhausted the whole unit can be disposed of. For
medical and non medical applications.

 

0111260 MaxO2+A Oxygen analyser. Internal sensor can be replaced when exhausted. For medical and non medical applications.

 

 

For a unit with the sensor on an extension lead then we can offer.

0111261 MaxO2+A Oxygen analyser. External sensor can be replaced when exhausted. For medical and non medical applications.

 

The above are just analyzers, we can also offer oxygen monitors that have alarms.

 

I would not usually advocate them buying spare sensors now as the ones in the units will typically last say 1 -3 years.

 

 

Regards

 

Steve

 

 

On Thu, 2 Feb 2023 at 09:29, Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Kind regards
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Janine Gill

Office Administrator

Viamed Ltd.
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---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Thu, 2 Feb 2023 at 09:20
Subject: Fwd: Portable oxygen analyzer
To: Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

 

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
Date: Thu, 2 Feb 2023 at 09:11
Subject: Fwd: Portable oxygen analyzer
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

 

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Khalid N. Alezi <khalid.natiq@alnafath.com>
Date: Thu, 2 Feb 2023 at 08:45
Subject: Portable oxygen analyzer
To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: <enquiries@viamed.co.uk>

 

Dear Sirs,

 

 

Our company is looking for esteemed company to supply us with portable oxygen analyzer Qty.5 + Qty.5 spare sensor according to
below specifications

 

 

Measuring range 0-100%, it consist of three major parts ( measuring device, measuring sensor (chemical) & flow diverter.
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Hope to hear from you shortly

 

 

 

Best regards

 

Eng. Khalid N. Al Ezi

 

 

 

--

Steve

 

 

Steve Nixon

Director - Viamed Ltd.

 

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267

 

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

.

http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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