24/11/2023, 13:34 Gmail - Re: Order

M Gma“ Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Re: Order

2 messages

majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com> 24 November 2023 at 13:27

Reply-To: majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com>
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi
We have not postcode

Sabeel alyoser medical company

Alzawia street infront of plastic surgery hospital
tripoli-Libya

00218925813652

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On 2023 ,24 ,»«és Axaall at 3:13 -, Kate Griffiths
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Thank you for your order. | would need a full address in order to find the carriage charge.
| need a street name please, and a postcode.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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On Fri, 24 Nov 2023 at 12:43, majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hi
My address is
Infront plastic surgery hospital -Tripoli-Libya
00218925813652

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1783301799395777171%7Cmsg-f:178345209745312... 1/4


https://mail.onelink.me/107872968?pid=nativeplacement&c=Global_Acquisition_YMktg_315_Internal_EmailSignature&af_sub1=Acquisition&af_sub2=Global_YMktg&af_sub3=&af_sub4=100000604&af_sub5=EmailSignature__Static_
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com
https://mail.onelink.me/107872968?pid=nativeplacement&c=Global_Acquisition_YMktg_315_Internal_EmailSignature&af_sub1=Acquisition&af_sub2=Global_YMktg&af_sub3=&af_sub4=100000604&af_sub5=EmailSignature__Static_

24/11/2023, 13:34 Gmail - Re: Order

On 2023 ,24 w5 Axesll at 2:41 5, majdi majdi
<dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com> wrote:

Hello
Send me invoice with 30 pcs R 23 oxygen sensor for draeger anaesthesia machine
10 boxes flow sensor for draeger anaesthesia machine Gs

2 pcs R 30V
Including shipping to Libya
Plz put final price

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On 2023 ,24 »ds dxaall gt 1:53 &, Kate Griffiths
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi,

Yes, these are the same product as the Viamed branded ones. Part number 4310007 is the Bluepoint
branded version.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 24 Nov 2023 at 11:45, majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hello
Is flow sensor 4310002 same as 4310007, also price same?
Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On 2023 ,23 _wdsi ,ouedll at 11:48 L=, Kate Griffiths
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning,
Thank you for your enquiry.
The prices are as follows:

Part number 0110023 - R-23V £34.00 each These are currently in stock
Part number 0110040 - R-30V £53.60 each These are currently in stock
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24/11/2023, 13:34 Gmail - Re: Order
Part number 0111261 - MaxO2 +AE oxygen analyser £307.20 each. These are currently in stock

Part number 4310007 - Flowsensor A - Single use flow sensor, box of 5 for Draeger anaesthesia
machine Fabius GS. These are currently in stock.
The price breaks are as follows:

1-9 boxes
= 10-24 boxes gg;gi: 100'249 boxes 11750 or more boxes = £40.00
2;1(:?].00 £55.00 each [[£50.00 each |[£45.00 each  ||%2°"

Please let me know if you would like a proforma invoice, | have your addresses as follows from your

last order:
Delivery Address Invoice Address
Mjdi W M Jaber Sabeel Alyoser Medical
Aramex UK SNS, TIP 184264 182-21 150th Avenue
Unit 9 Skyport Drive TIP 184264
West Drayton Springfield Gardens
Harmondsworth New York
UB7 OLB 11413

United States

Carriage would be £12 (for the UK). We would charge VAT but it could be credited to you if proof of
export is received.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the
office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where
possible.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 22 Nov 2023 at 21:38, majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com> wrote:
Hello
| hope you are doing well.
Could you please send me estimate of the following
Oxygen sensor
R 23V. 30PCS
R30V2PCS
Max O2 +AE 2PCS
Draeger anaesthesia machine fabius GS flow sensor 4 boxes
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24/11/2023, 13:34 Gmail - Re: Order

Best regards

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> 24 November 2023 at 13:31
Draft To: majdi majdi <dr_majdi_wanis@yahoo.com>

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

[Quoted text hidden]
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