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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Proforma for veterinary capnograph accessories
1 message

Robyn Vickers (Terrington Vets) <Robyn.vickers@terringtonvets.co.uk> 16 November 2023 at 08:33
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Good morning, 

I thought my head nurse had contacted you sorry, we don't wish to proceed. 
Sorry for wasting your time and thank you for your assistance. 

Kind Regards
Robyn Mead
Registered Veterinary Nurse

Terrington Veterinary Centre

24 Marshland Street

Terrington St Clements

King's Lynn

Norfolk 

PE34 4NE

01553 828423

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Wednesday, November 15, 2023 3:07 PM
To: Robyn Vickers (Terrington Vets) <Robyn.vickers@terringtonvets.co.uk>
Cc: Steve Hardaker <steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk>
Subject: Re: Proforma for veterinary capnograph accessories
 

Good afternoon Robyn,

I hope you are well.

Please could I ask if proforma invoice MVM146209 is still required?  It expires next week on November 20th, at which
time I am required to delete it.

I can of course issue another proforma invoice at any time.

Many thanks.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Fri, 20 Oct 2023 at 11:09, Steve Hardaker <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Robyn,

Please find attached a proforma invoice for the veterinary capnograph accessories that we discussed.

This includes the IRMA analyser (which measures the CO2 in exhaled gases), and a pulse oximetry Y-sensor with 3
different sized lingual clips. We include a small clip with the sensor free of charge by default, so only the other 2 are
chargeable.

Orders should be sent to the sales office at orders@viamed.co.uk please can you also send a remittance advice once
payment has been made so that we can tie the payment to your order. 

We have all of the items in stock so delivery should be within 2 days of receipt of payment of the proforma.

Best regards,

Steve Hardaker
Technical Support Manager
Viamed Ltd.
Please note:  Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.  

Website: www.viamed.co.uk
email: steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd 
Facebook: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 
Company registered in England, No. 1291765.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542
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