02/11/2023, 16:49 Gmail - Re: Your proforma invoices

M Gma“ Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Your proforma invoices
1 message

Nammu Tech <anthony@nammu-tech.io> 2 November 2023 at 14:42

To: kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com
Hi Kate
This invoice has now been paid
Please arrange shipping
Thanks

Kind Regards

ANTHONY SMITH
MANAGING DIRECTOR

ANTHONYG@NAMMU-TECH.IO
l NAMMUL \ +44 (0)330 043 0761
TECH

Unit 1B, Upton Business Centre
Welland Rd, WRA ODSW

Worcester

On 2 Nov 2023 at 13:36 +0000, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>, wrote:

Good afternoon Anthony,
I hope you are well.

Steve Nixon has asked me to email you to let you know that we are able to ship your sensors upon
receipt of payment.

| have attached a copy of the proforma invoice with updated dates as it had expired.

Many thanks,

Kate Griffiths

Vandagraph Sensor Technologies

On Tue, 5 Sept 2023 at 13:42, Kate Giriffiths <kate.griffiths@vandagraphst.com> wrote:
Good afternoon Anthony,
Thank you for your orders. Please see attached proforma invoices, please let me know if you would like
any changes to be made. | have noted your delivery dates, but these will not show until your proforma

invoices are changed to orders upon receipt of payment.

Steve Nixon has asked me to inform you that we will let you know any production dates as soon as we
have the information available.

| have also attached the Declaration of Conformity.
Many thanks.

Kate Griffiths

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a:r-6655908346869927940%7Cmsg-f:17814636981129...
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