25/10/2023, 14:52 Gmail - RE: 9100-9212-2

M G ma" Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: 9100-9212-2

1 message
Matt <matt@chambersoceanics.com> 25 October 2023 at 14:35

To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
Cc: mike <mike@mmocean.com>, Farris Pask <farris@chambersoceanics.com>

Fazz,
Can you order 6 x units.
Cheers.

Matt

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Wednesday, October 25, 2023 2:33 PM

To: Matt <matt@chambersoceanics.com>

Subject: Re: 9100-9212-2

Hi Matt

Our equivalent is the R-33VAN-2 = £65 each EXW

We have 8x available from stock.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 25 Oct 2023 at 13:47, Matt <matt@chambersoceanics.com> wrote:
Ryan,
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Could you please let me know the availability and pricing on the following:

6 x 9100-9212-2

Cheers.

Matt
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