12/10/2023, 09:51 Gmail - Fwd: Flow Sensors

M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Flow Sensors

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 12 October 2023 at 09:24
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed <agib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill
<janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi, please can we process the order, the Maquet sensor is already on CVM144924, but can be added to this order if it simplifies things.
We can not supply the babylog flow sensors she mentioned, but | will let her know.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jelena Doderovic <jelena@medisal.co.rs>

Date: Thu, 12 Oct 2023 at 07:32

Subject: RE: Flow Sensors

To: <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>, Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Zoey and Ryan
Please find below our new order. You mention you will send samples to test for Maquet Servo i. And mention some for Drager Babylog you have also?

Include pls in shipment and add on invoice ( put some symbolic price, don’t write “0”)
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12.10.2023.

One shipment

Order for Invoice no 1 -

REF Item Quantity pcs
1 110432 | MAX-250(B) Oxygen Sensor 2
2 110024 | O2 sensor R24 2
3 110022 | O2 sensor R-22MED 10

Srdacgan pozdrav/Kind regards
Jelena Doderovi¢
OD 29.05.2023. SE NALAZIMO NA NOVOJ ADRESI
SRETENJSKA 29
11272 DOBANOVCI
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: ponedeljak, 21. avgust 2023. 18:27

To: Jelena Doderovic <jelena@medisal.co.rs>

Subject: Re: Flow Sensors

Thank you Jelena

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 21 Aug 2023 at 17:23, Jelena Doderovic <jelena@medisal.co.rs> wrote:

Dear Ryan

Thank you for your reply.

Yes we still have demand, but we had some stock in past.

Yes we also have potential for Babylog.
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Jelena

On 21. 8. 2023., at 19:01, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Jelena

| am just looking at our flow sensors sales and it seems you have not had any for a while and | wanted to check in with you to see if you still have requirements
for them or if there is a problem we should know about.

| am sure | have mentioned this before, but we are aiming to have a version for the Drager Babylog, please let me know if this would be of interest to you? If
so | will add you to my list and inform you as soon as they are ready.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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