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Syed Gouse Mohiuddin

Sales | Source1 Distribution

 

 

D: +1 346-249-8009

smohiuddin@s1distribution.com

www.s1distribution.com

747 Kenrick Dr, Ste 124

Houston TX 77060 USA

Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: INRFQ-026418 - VM
1 message

Syed Gouse Mohiuddin <smohiuddin@s1distribution.com> 11 October 2023 at 14:23
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi,

 

Thanks for the quote. Our billing address and shipping address are same and mentioned in my signature below.

 

Can you please advise about the shipping point and weight of the shipment to estimate freight to our warehouse at
Houston 77060.

 

Regards,

 

  AS OF MAY 1st WE HAVE
RELOCATED TO OUR NEW
FACILITY ON KENRICK DR.

 

From: Main Account
<viamedinbox@gmail.com> On
Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Wednesday, October 11, 2023

6:57 AM
To: Syed Gouse Mohiuddin <smohiuddin@s1distribution.com>
Subject: Re: INRFQ-026418 - VM

 

Good afternoon Syed,

 

Thank you for your enquiry.

 

The price breaks for part number 0110950 - Nitrogen sensor N-33 are as follows:

 

1 = $ 63.50 2 = $ 57.15 each EXW 3 - 10 = $ 53.98 each EXW 11 or more = $ 50.80 each EXW

 

The lead time would be approximately 8-12 weeks.

 

If you require an official quotation or proforma invoice, detailing carriage charge, insurance and bank charges, I would
need your delivery and invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you.
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Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls
to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 11 Oct 2023 at 08:09, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Syed Gouse Mohiuddin <smohiuddin@s1distribution.com>
Date: Tue, 10 Oct 2023 at 19:31
Subject: INRFQ-026418 - VM
To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Balachandran Gopichandran <bala@s1distribution.com>

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:smohiuddin@s1distribution.com
mailto:info@viamed.co.uk
mailto:info@viamed.co.uk
mailto:bala@s1distribution.com


11/10/2023, 14:50 Gmail - RE: INRFQ-026418 - VM

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1779442064443377924%7Cmsg-f:177946558993966… 3/3

Syed Gouse Mohiuddin

Sales | Source1 Distribution

 

 

D: +1 346-249-8009

smohiuddin@s1distribution.com

www.s1distribution.com

747 Kenrick Dr, Ste 124

Houston TX 77060 USA

Hi,

 

Please let us have your most competitive offer on the following items for resale and indicate current lead time and
delivery to Houston 77060.

 

Description / Details : Sensor, Oxygen, Type N-33, Maintenance-Free and Sealed, For Viamed Model AN300 Nitrogen
Analyser

Manufacturer : VIAMED

Part no / Model no / Type : 0110950

Qty : 2 EA

 

Thanks

 

Regards,

 

  AS OF MAY 1st WE HAVE
RELOCATED TO OUR
NEW FACILITY ON
KENRICK DR.

 

image001.png
4K

tel:+1%20346-249-8309
mailto:smohiuddin@s1distribution.com
http://www.s1distribution.com/
https://www.google.com/maps/search/747+Kenrick+Dr,+Ste+124+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+Houston+TX+77060+USA?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/747+Kenrick+Dr,+Ste+124+%0D%0A+%0D%0A+Houston+TX+77060+USA?entry=gmail&source=g
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ui=2&ik=b5871a5be0&view=att&th=18b1ee86aa6281dc&attid=0.1&disp=inline&safe=1&zw
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ui=2&ik=b5871a5be0&view=att&th=18b1ee86aa6281dc&attid=0.1&disp=inline&safe=1&zw

