10/10/2023, 08:21 Gmail - RE: [SUSPICIOUS MESSAGE] Re: FW: TOF 3D Purchase

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: [SUSPICIOUS MESSAGE] Re: FW: TOF 3D Purchase

1 message

Gillies Moffat <Gillies.Moffat@cvsvets.com> 9 October 2023 at 18:48

To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Anna Jennings <Anna.Jennings@cvsvets.com>
Cc: Steve Hardaker <steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate,

Our CAPEX number is your PO number so if you could please email apquery@cvsvets.com your invoice quoting the

CAPEX number FACVS006927 that will be fine.

Kind regards,

Gillies

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: 08 October 2023 14:49

To: Gillies Moffat <Gillies.Moffat@cvsvets.com>; Anna Jennings <Anna.Jennings@cvsvets.com>
Cc: Steve Hardaker <steve.hardaker@yviamed.co.uk>

Subject: [SUSPICIOUS MESSAGE] Re: FW: TOF 3D Purchase

This might be a fraudulent message!

will be sent to kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk.

When clicking REPLY, your answers will NOT go to the sender (viamedinbox@gmail.com). Replies

J

Good afternoon Gilles,

Thank you for your reply.

Please accept my apologies, | am unsure what CAPEX is. It is not something we have ever used before.

Please could you clarify what you need us to do?

I will turn your quotation to a proforma invoice tomorrow when | am in the office. Is there a PO number you would like

us to use?

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1779025821524552421%7Cmsg-f:177930108534025...

13


mailto:apquery@cvsvets.com
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:Gillies.Moffat@cvsvets.com
mailto:Anna.Jennings@cvsvets.com
mailto:steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

10/10/2023, 08:21 Gmail - RE: [SUSPICIOUS MESSAGE] Re: FW: TOF 3D Purchase
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Sun, 8 Oct 2023 at 14:45, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Gillies Moffat <Gillies.Moffat@cvsvets.com>

Date: Fri, 6 Oct 2023 at 16:03

Subject: FW: TOF 3D Purchase

To: steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk <steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Anna Jennings <Anna.Jennings@cvsvets.com>
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10/10/2023, 08:21 Gmail - RE: [SUSPICIOUS MESSAGE] Re: FW: TOF 3D Purchase
Hi Steve,

Apologies | should have confirmed the delivery address!
Seadown Veterinary Hospital

Frost Lane

Hythe

Southampton

S045 3NG

Kind regards,

Gillies

From: Gillies Moffat

Sent: 06 October 2023 15:59

To: steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk

Cc: Anna Jennings <Anna.Jennings@cvsvets.com>
Subject: TOF 3D Purchase

Good afternoon Steve,

Please find attached quotation for the TOF 3D , that Anna Jennings has approached you about. | would like to
confirm the order, and the required CAPEX number that you will need to attach to this, when sending to
apquery@cvsvets.com is FACVS006928.

Kind regards,

Gillies Moffat

Clinical Director

Seadown Vets
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