09/10/2023, 10:37 Gmail - Fwd: PROFORMA REQUEST/ MASTERMED / DUBAI

M Gma" Janine Gill <viamed.janine.gill@gmail.com>

Fwd: PROFORMA REQUEST/ MASTERMED / DUBAI

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 9 October 2023 at 10:28
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>, Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Agib Majeed
<aqgib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>, Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi

Please can send a proforma invoice to Roshil @ Mastermed
Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Mastermed Equipment Trading LLC <mastermd@emirates.net.ae>
Date: Fri, 6 Oct 2023 at 15:38
Subject: PROFORMA REQUEST/ MASTERMED / DUBAI
To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>, <office@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: <roshil@mastermed.info>
Dear Ryan ,
Please send me proforma invoice for following
1. R-23V Oxygen sensor - QTY 20
2. R-43V Oxygen snesor -QTY 4
3. R-30V Oxygen sensor -QTY 3
4. R-22MEDV Oxygen sensor -QTY 5
5. MAX-250A Oxygen sensor -QTY 2
Kindly arrange the items to ship by monday . Please send me proforma invoice to send the payment .
Thanks & Regards
Roshil | Sales & Service Engineer
Tel. +971 4 4226919 | Mob. +971 55 421 5563

MASTERMED EQUIPMENT TRADING LLC
EO07, Shop No: 12, China, Cluster, International City

P.B.No: 114737, Dubai, UAE

mastermd@emirates.net.ae
www.mastermed.info
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Email Disclaimer: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the

recipient specified in message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part
of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the sender.
If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and
follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur
in the future.

On 22/08/23 03:57 PM, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Roshil
| hope this email finds you well.

| just wanted to catch up with you and find out if you have any requirements for either our Drager or
Hamilton compatible flow sensors?

| believe you have purchased oxygen sensors for Drager ventilators, so | thought the flow sensors could be
a good addition to your portfolio.

I look forward to hearing from you.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Dear Sir,

Greetings from Mastermed !!

We are pleased to send the quotation for the requested items . Please find the attached quotation and Catalog .
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