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M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: The TOF watch

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 5 October 2023 at 14:47

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Anna Jennings <annafjennings@hotmail.com>

Date: Thu, 5 Oct 2023 at 14:38

Subject: Fwd: The TOF watch

To: steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk <steve.hardaker@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Gillies Moffat <Gillies.Moffat@cvsvets.com>

Hi Steve,

I hope you're well.

Please see below email from Denise, who starts work with us next week.

Could you please email myself/Gillies a quotation for the equipment she's requesting.

The invoice should be made out to CVS Group plc, CVS House, Owen Road, Diss, Norfolk. IP22 4ER
The delivery address would be Seadown vets, Frost Lane, Hythe SO45 3NG

Many thanks,

Anna Jennings

Clinical director

Sent from Outlook for iOS

From: Anna Jennings <annafjennings@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 28, 2023 9:07 am

To: Denise Moore <denise.moore@cvsvets.com>
Cc: Gillies Moffat <gilliesmoffat@hotmail.com>
Subject: Re: The TOF watch

Thanks Denise for clarifying this.

We have the final senior nurse interview next week, so things should become clearer after that on the nursing front!
Many thanks,

Anna

Sent from Outlook for iOS

From: Denise Moore <denise.moore@cvsvets.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 26, 2023 4:54 pm

To: 'Anna Jennings' <annafjennings@hotmail.com>
Subject: The TOF watch

Dear Anna

| hope you got the email with the quote for this.

This is what is needed:

1.The TOF 3D machine

2.Main cable Ref: 5750108

3.Acceleration transducer Ref: 5750105
4.Stimulation cables with pinch clamps Ref: 5750107

(we don’t need any extra bits!)

Thank you
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Denise

Lumbry Park Veterinary

Denise M hthalmologi
enise Moore Ophthalmologist Specialists

t: 01420 481777 e: denise.moore@cvsvets.com w: www.cvsukltd.co.uk

Lumbry Park Veterinary Specialists, Selborne Road, Alton, Hampshire, GU34 3HL

CVS (UK) Limited; Registered in England; Company Number 3777473; Registered Office: CVS House, Owen Road, Diss, Norfolk, IP22 4ER
The information contained in this email may be privileged and or confidential. If you have received this email in error, please destroy it and notify

the sender immediately. You may not rely on the content of this email unless you are the intended recipient.

Clinical advice is based only on the available history and laboratory data not upon a physical examination of the patient. It must therefore only be
interpreted by a currently registered veterinary surgeon and responsibility for the care of this patient remains with the attending clinician, email

advice cannot replace consultation offered by full referral, care should be taken to avoid misrepresentation of advice provided in clinical notation.
Radiographic interpretation unless by a board certified radiologist is an informal report only, if a formal report is sought please request specifically,
reporting of imaging requires DICOM format others limit image quality and are not diagnostic. Please contact our administration team if you

require advice on provision of this format.

Emails may contain viruses and can be altered in transit. CVS accept no liability for any error, loss or damage caused by the use or misuse of

this email or any attachment.
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