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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: trade order:
1 message

Diving Equipement <contact@divingequipement.com> 28 September 2023 at 13:20
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,

 

Thank you for your message.

I need sensor quickly, could you send me the one who are available and let the R17S1 in backorder?

 

I can’t make a bank transfer in £, could you send me a credit card link ?

 

Thank you,

 

 

Mickaël
Diving Equipement

Contact@divingequipement.com

03 20 98 18 69

divingequipement.com

 

 

 

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Ryan Swaine
Envoyé : jeudi 28 septembre 2023 13:53
À : Diving Equipement <contact@divingequipement.com>
Objet : Re: trade order:

 

Dear Mickaël

 

Thank you very much for your email and I apologise for the late reply.

 

Please find your proforma invoice attached. All of the products are available from stock apart from the R-17S1, they
are due to arrive with us sometime over the course of the next 7-10 days.
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If you wish to proceed with the order, you can make your payment using the bank account details at the bottom of the
invoice or you can use a credit card. I can send you a link for card payments if required.

 

I look forward to hearing from you and please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Wed, 27 Sept 2023 at 13:09, Diving Equipement <contact@divingequipement.com> wrote:

Hi,

 

I would like to order :

 

5x 0110224 R-33DE (Analox O2EII, O2EII Pro, 9100-9220-9B)
5x 0110232 R-22VAN (Oxyspy)
1x 0110237 R-17S1 (Nuvair Pro O2)
1x 0110239 R-33VAN-RP (Analox 9100-9212-5AD)
1x 0110041 R-41V (OOM202-1, M-03, LMNT Analysers & Blenders, D-01H, DE-OX ZIP)
2x 0110238 R-22AT (Analox ATA, ATA Pro, 9100-9212-94)
2x 7910201 TEK-OX Oxygen Analyser (inc. Sensor/Quick-Ox/Dry Box) - Auto switch-off

 

Thank you

 

 

Mickaël
Diving Equipement

Contact@divingequipement.com

03 20 98 18 69

divingequipement.com
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