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Aqib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Fwd: Oxygen Analyser
Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 27 September 2023 at 16:40
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Aqib Majeed <aqib.majeed@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi Aqib, please can you send Keith a proforma invoice:

2x MaxO2+AE Oxygen analyser - pn. 0111261  = GBP £384 each EXW

Please ship by standard UPS, the cost is £12

Company name: Moy Park

Address:
Killyman Road
Dungannon
BT71 6LN

Phone: 028 8772 2300

Contact: Keith Wilson - Standards Manager
Keith.Wilson@moypark.com

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Keith Wilson <Keith.Wilson@moypark.com>
Date: Wed, 27 Sept 2023 at 12:44
Subject: RE: Oxygen Analyser
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Thank you

 

 

Keith Wilson
Broiler Legal Compliance/Standards Manager

Moy Park
Killyman Road
Dungannon
BT71 6LN

Phone: 028 8772 2300,518#
Mobile: 07810440268
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keith.wilson@moypark.com
https://moypark.com/

Moy Park Limited process your data in accordance with our privacy statement available on our website
https://moypark.com/footer/privacy-policy. The information contained in this message and any
attached files is intended for the exclusive use of the individual to whom it is addressed and may
contain information that is confidential, proprietary, privileged and/or exempt from disclosure under
applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for delivering
this message to an intended recipient, please send a reply to this e-mail and then delete the message and
all attachments from your computer without retaining any copies.
Unauthorised use, disclosure, forwarding, redistribution and/or reproduction of this communication, its
attachments or any part thereof, in any way whatsoever, is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
º Moy Park Limited. Registered in Northern Ireland. No. 4842, 39 Seagoe Ind Estate, Portadown,
Craigavon, Co. Armagh, BT63 5QE.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Wednesday, September 27, 2023 12:42 PM
To: Keith Wilson <Keith.Wilson@moypark.com>
Subject: Re: Oxygen Analyser

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organisation. Do not click links or
open attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe. Cet
email provient de l’extérieur de votre organisation. Ne cliquez pas sur les liens et
n’ouvrez pas les pièces jointes, sauf si vous identifiez l’expéditeur et que vous savez
que le contenu est sans risque.

 

On Tue, 26 Sept 2023 at 16:36, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

Hi Keith

 

Thank you very much for your call. Please find a brochure attached for the MaxO2+AE, I believe this will meet
your requirements. .

 

MaxO2+AE Oxygen analyser - pn. 0111261 = GBP £384 each EXW

 

I look forward to your feedback and please let me know if you have any questions.

 

Kind regards

Ryan

 

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
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www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

 

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
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