26/09/2023, 10:27

M Gmail

Re: RFQ SNG-WS-104

1 message

abe loh <abe@nordico-services.com>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan.
| will use this email as order confirmation.
Can you send me a Pl and a link for me to make the payment?

R-33VAN-2 = GBP £65 each EXW
Lead time would be typically 1-2 weeks

R-33VAN-4 = GBP £65 each EXW
Lead time would be typically 1-2 weeks

Best Regards,
Abe Loh

Nordico Services Singapore
+6593886902

Gmail - Re: RFQ SNG-WS-104

Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

26 September 2023 at 07:16

On Tue, 19 Sept 2023 at 16:58, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Abe
Thank you very much for your enquiry.

R-33VAN-2 = GBP £65 each EXW
Lead time would be typically 1-2 weeks

R-33VAN-4 = GBP £65 each EXW
Lead time would be typically 1-2 weeks

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 19 Sept 2023 at 06:01, abe loh <abe@nordico-services.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

have an inquiry from 1 of my clients.

6 Ea Analox O2 Cell 9212-2 (R33VAN-2)
6 Ea Analox O2 Cell 9212-4 (R33VAN-4)

Pls assist with checking and quote me the best price and lead time.

Thank you.
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Best Regards,
Abe Loh

Nordico Services Singapore
+6593886902
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