26/09/2023, 09:21 Gmail - Re: EnviteC:1000470 Box Flowsensor, SpiroQuant A+ STD

M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

Re: EnviteC:1000470 Box Flowsensor, SpiroQuant A+ STD

Gilbert Macalinao <purchasing@arabeuropemed.com> 26 September 2023 at 06:17
Reply-To: gilbert@arabeuropemed.com
To: aqgib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Dear Aqib,
Can you send me official quotation for 50 pieces to process purchase order and payment.
Regards,
Gilbert
On 18/09/2023 3:00 PM, Agib Majeed wrote:
Hello Gilbert
Good afternoon
Please see attached information.
Kind regards
Aqib Majeed

Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email: agib.majeed@yviamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 18 Sept 2023 at 11:33, Aqib Majeed <aqgib.majeed@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello

Good morning
Yes if you buy 20 x it is $60.00 each.
Kind regards

Aqgib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email; agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535
634542
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On Mon, 18 Sept 2023 at 10:57, Gilbert Macalinao <purchasing@arabeuropemed.com> wrote:
Dear Aqib,
Is this mentioned in your catalogue.
Regards,
Gilbert
On 18/09/2023 12:22 PM, Aqgib Majeed wrote:
Hello

Good morning

Yes we have an alternative to the Envitec: 1000470 Box Flowsensor which is the SpiroTrue A (4310007) - Single Use Flow Sensor Box Of 5, |
will list our current price breaks below.

4310007 - SpiroTrue A Single Use Flow Sensor Box of 5.
[1-9=9120.00 each [[10-24 = $60.00 each [[25-99 =$ 55.00 each [[100 - 249 = $ 50.00 each [[250 + = § 45.00 each |

Please let me know if | can assist with anything else.
Kind regards

Agib Majeed
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

email; agib.majeed@yviamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

Please note: Viamed is enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main
office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

E-mail Disclaimer
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or
call +44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 18 Sept 2023 at 06:43, Gilbert Macalinao <purchasing@arabeuropemed.com> wrote:
Dear Sir,
Do you have alternative to EnviteC:1000470 Box Flowsensor, SpiroQuant A+ STD? If so please send us offer and best delivery lead time.

Need 20 pieces.

Best Regards,

Gilbert Macalinao

Purchase Officer

Arab European Medical Equip. Tr. LLC

T: 4971 4 368 8696 | F +971 4 368 8697

Arab European Medical Equip Tr. L.L.C

P.0. Box: 127748, Z-06 England cluster; S-07 International City, Dubai,
U.A.E

http://www.arabeuropemed.com/

Best Regards,

Gilbert Macalinao

Purchase Officer

Arab European Medical Equip. Tr. LLC

T: +971 4 368 8696 | F +971 4 368 8697

Arab European Medical Equip Tr. L.L.C

P.0. Box: 127748, Z-06 England cluster; S-07 International City, Dubai,
U.A.E

http://www.arabeuropemed.com/

Best Regards,

Gilbert Macalinao
Purchase Officer
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