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M Gmail Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: For Your Information: Aneurin Bevan University Health Board - Standard Purchase Order 33922063, 0

1 message

NWSSP ProcurementCatalogueWomensHealth (NWSSP) <NWSSP.ProcurementCatalogueWomensHea@wales.nhs.uk>
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Hi

Yes please add a memo re £12 max charge

For info | have noted on the catalogue that carriage is applicable so requestors see this note to add the carriage line

Supplier Supplier PO Description Supplier Item UoM Price Long Desc
Name Site Number
VIAMED LTD EEIZGOHLEY 33157884 CARRIAGE - 1 PACK (EACH) (CARRIAGEPA4823-1) CARRIAGlEPA4823_ Each £8.000 -
VIAMED LTD EEIZGOHLEY 33157884 CARRIAGE - 2 - 4 PACKS (EACH) (CARRIAGEPA4823-2) CARRIAGZEPA4823_ Each £10.000 -
VIAMED LTD EEE)IZGOHLEY 33157884 CARRIAGE - 5+ PACKS (EACH) (CARRIAGEPA4823-3) CARRIAG3EPA4823_ Each £12.000 -

**Please note carriage applicable

KEIGHLEY EYEMAX PHOTOTHERAPY MASK - MICRO 20CM - 26CM orders** : for 5+ packs (CARRIAGE
VIAMED LTD BD20 33157884 (PACK20) (1114007) 1114007 PACK20 £55.300 ¢ 0g pack (CARRIAGEPA4823-2) f
(CARRIAGEPA4823-1)
"Please note carriage applicable to ¢
KEIGHLEY EYEMAX PHOTOTHERAPY MASK - PREEMIE 26CM - 32CM : for 5+ packs (CARRIAGEP4823-3;
VIAMED LTD BD20 33157884 (PACK20) (1114006) 1114006 PACK20 £55.300 pack (CARRIAGEPA4823-2) for 1
(CARRIAGEPA4823-1)
"Please note carriage applicable to ¢
KEIGHLEY EYEMAX PHOTOTHERAPY MASK - REGULAR 32CM - 38CM : for 5+ packs (CARRIAGEP4823-3’
VIAMED LTD BD20 33157884 (PACK20) (1114005) 1114005 PACK20 £55.300 pack (CARRIAGEPA4823-2) for 1
(CARRIAGEPA4823-1)
Many thanks
Del

Ms Delyth Jones

Swyddoges Categori - Clinical
Category Officer - Clinical
Partneriaeth Cydwasanaethau GIG Cymru — Gwasanaethau Caffael

NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership — Procurement Serices
Ffon Tel: 01745 366823
E-bost E-mail: delyth.jones4@wales.nhs.uk

Sgwrsio a mi Chat with me on  Microsoft Teams

Rwy’n rhugl yn y Gymraeg ac mae Partneriaeth Cydwasanaethau GIG Cymru yn croesawugohebiaeth yn u Gynrage a Saesneg.

I'm fluent in Welsh and NHS Wales Shared Servies Partnerhip welcomes correspondence in Welsh & English

S
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GIG | Partneriaeth

Cydwasanaethau

MNHS | Shared Services
~ | Partnership

4 Helpwch arbed papur - oes angen i chi printio’r e-bost yma?

Help save paper - do you need to print this e mail?

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: Monday, September 18, 2023 2:36 PM

To: NWSSP ProcurementCatalogueWomensHealth (NWSSP) <NWSSP.ProcurementCatalogueWWomensHea@wales.nhs.uk>; OracleEBS (Cardiff and Vale UHB - Central Team Ebusin
Subject: Re: For Your Information: Aneurin Bevan University Health Board - Standard Purchase Order 33922063, 0

WARNING: This email originated from outside of NHS Wales. Do not open links or attachments unless you know the content is safe.

Good afternoon,

Just a quick email to ask if | am able to proceed.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 14 Sept 2023 at 10:34, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning,

Thank you for your order.

The carriage charge for this order is £12, are you happy to proceed? We have a memo on your account to say carriage up to £10 is accepted.
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If it helps, would you like us to add a memo to show a maximum charge of £12 is accepted for carriage on your orders?
Please let me know if you would like me to proceed with the carriage charge.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to us

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 14 Sept 2023 at 10:01, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Workflow Mailer <OracleEBS@wales.nhs.uk>

Date: Thu, 14 Sept 2023 at 09:58

Subject: For Your Information: Aneurin Bevan University Health Board - Standard Purchase Order 33922063, 0
To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>

From Womens Health, GHC

To info@viamed.co.uk

Sent  14-SEP-23 09:51:17

D 42300275

Please review the purchase order and any other document attached to this message.
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