13/09/2023, 16:15 Gmail - FW: New Order: GW/FIG/298553

M Gma” Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
FW: New Order: GW/FIG/298553

1 message

Georgina Wickenden <georgina@richard-james.co.uk> 13 September 2023 at 16:13

To: Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate

Thanks for your email. We are happy to go with the alternative offered please.
Many thanks

Georgina

Georgina Wickenden

Richard James International Limited
Worthy Road

Chittening Industrial Estate
Avonmouth

Bristol

BS11 0YB

Telephone No: +44-(0)117 9828 575
Fax No: +44-(0)117 9826 361

E-Mail: georgina@richard-james.co.uk
Web: richardjamesinternational.co.uk
Registered in England No: 2568599

Registered Office: Bath House, 6-8 Bath Street, Bristol, BS1 6HL

All business is transacted under the BIFA Standard Trading Conditions 2021 Edition which is available upon request.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1776383773459988677%7Cmsg-f:1776935799124134...

1/4


mailto:georgina@richard-james.co.uk
http://richardjamesinternational.co.uk/

13/09/2023, 16:15 Gmail - FW: New Order: GW/FIG/298553

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 07 September 2023 14:32

To: Georgina Wickenden <georgina@richard-james.co.uk>

Subject: Re: New Order: GW/FIG/298553

Good afternoon Georgina,

Thank you for your order. Please could | advise you that part number 0110410 has a lead time of approximately 8-
10 weeks. We do have the alternative 0110040 - oxygen sensor R-30V in stock. The price is £67.00 each.

Please see attached technical specification sheet.

Please let me know if you require the alternative.

I have the used thre following for the addresses on your order:

Delivery Address Invoice Address

Richard James International Ltd Richard James International Ltd
Worthy Road Worthy Road

Chittening Industrial Estate Chittening Industrial Estate
Avonmouth Avonmouth

Bristol Bristol

BS11 0YB BS11 0YB

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 7 Sept 2023 at 14:10, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Georgina Wickenden <georgina@richard-james.co.uk>
Date: Thu, 7 Sept 2023 at 13:59

Subject: New Order: GW/FIG/298553

To: orders@viamed.online <orders@viamed.online>

Good afternoon

Please can you process the following order for me:

Purchase order no: GW/FIG/AIR/298553

2 x 0110017 Oxygen Sensor R-17MED @ £53 each = £106 total

1 x 0110410 MAX-10 Avance Oxygen Sensor @ £88.40

I look forward to hearing from you.

Many thanks

Georgina

Georgina Wickenden

Richard James International Limited
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Worthy Road

Chittening Industrial Estate
Avonmouth

Bristol

BS11 0YB

Telephone No: +44-(0)117 9828 575
Fax No: +44-(0)117 9826 361

E-Mail: georgina@richard-james.co.uk
Web: richardjamesinternational.co.uk
Registered in England No: 2568599

Registered Office: Bath House, 6-8 Bath Street, Bristol, BS1 6HL

All business is transacted under the BIFA Standard Trading Conditions 2021 Edition which is available upon request.

b% Please consider the environment before printing this email

ﬂ 0110040 Specification Datasheet 1D12328.pdf
265K
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