12/09/2023, 09:06 Gmail - RE: FW: 174613 / PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: FW: 174613 / PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd

1 message

Mohammad Imran | 3T Worldwide <mohammad.imran@3tworldwide.com> 12 September 2023 at 08:53
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Saisridhar Erra | 3T Worldwide <Sai.sridhar@3tworldwide.com>, Kushagra Shukla | 3T Worldwide
<kushagra.shukla@3tworldwide.com>

Hello
Yes please send us the quotation and yes the address remains the same
Thanks & Regards,

Mohammad Imran

3T Oil & Gas Services LLC
T: +1-1800-220-2438 Ext 4712 | M: +1-512-675-4712

F: +1-703-935-1111

QualiTy | ReliabiliTy | IntegriTy

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL: This Disclaimer is covered by the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C. §§ 2510-2521. This
communication may contain information that is proprietary, privileged, and confidential or otherwise legally protected from disclosure, and is
intended to be received and read only by certain individuals. If it has been misdirected, or if you suspect you have received this in error, you are
not authorized to read, print, retain copy or disseminate this message or any part of it. Delivery of this message or any portions herein to any
person other than the intended recipient is not intended to waive any right or privilege. Please notify sender immediately and delete all copies of
the message and its attachments.

TELEPHONE CONVERSATION: Our staff or designated agents may make and receive follow up calls for technical or commercial matters. All
calls may be recorded for quality assurance and training purposes. Please disconnect our calls and communicate only through emails if you do
not wish your conversations to be recorded.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: Tuesday, September 12, 2023 2:51 AM

To: Mohammad Imran | 3T Worldwide <mohammad.imran@3tworldwide.com>; Saisridhar Erra | 3T Worldwide
<Sai.sridhar@3tworldwide.com>; Kushagra Shukla | 3T Worldwide <kushagra.shukla@3tworldwide.com>
Subject: Re: FW: 174613 / PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd
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Good morning,

Thank you for your enquiry.

The prices are as follows:

3810000 Posey I.D. Bracelets - Newborn Model 4648 (14cm x 3cm)  $11.90 each box of 12

3810001 Posey I.D. Bracelets - Premie Model 4649 (7cm x 3cm) These have been discontinued by the supplier.

Do you still require a quotation for 40 x 38100007 If so are the addresses as follows please?

Delivery Address

Invoice Address

Three T Worldwide Global Trading WLL 3T Qil And Gas Services LLC
Office 1013 Regus, Shoumoukh Tower 701 Tillery Street

10th Floor, Tower B, P.O Box 55896
C Ring Road, Al Sadd

Doha

122001

Catar

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Suite 12
Austin

Texas

T&T02

United States

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 12 Sept 2023 at 08:35, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Mohammad Imran | 3T Worldwide <mohammad.imran@3tworldwide.com>

Date: Tue, 12 Sept 2023 at 07:52

Subject: FW: 174613 / PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Saisridhar Erra | 3T Worldwide <Sai.sridhar@3tworldwide.com>, Kushagra Shukla | 3T Worldwide
<kushagra.shukla@3tworldwide.com>

Hello

You had supplied the below item against PO SM1043735/3T-71023002 RFQ # 5901-2 Viamed Ltd

Please advise us is the price and delivery lead time still valid as per attached Invoice and if not please provide us the revised
quote.

SENSOR WRAP ID BRACELET FOR NEWBORN (Posey/4648)
Quantity: 40

SENSOR WRAP ID BRACELET FOR PREMIE (Posey/4649)
Quantity: 10

Thanks & Regards,

Mohammad Imran
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3T Oil & Gas Services LLC
T: +1-1800-220-2438 Ext 4712 | M: +1-512-675-4712

F: +1-703-935-1111

Quali L'y | Reliabili I'y | Integri I'y

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL: This Disclaimer is covered by the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C. §§ 2510-2521.
This communication may contain information that is proprietary, privileged, and confidential or otherwise legally protected from disclosure,
and is intended to be received and read only by certain individuals. If it has been misdirected, or if you suspect you have received this in
error, you are not authorized to read, print, retain copy or disseminate this message or any part of it. Delivery of this message or any
portions herein to any person other than the intended recipient is not intended to waive any right or privilege. Please notify sender
immediately and delete all copies of the message and its attachments.

TELEPHONE CONVERSATION: Our staff or designated agents may make and receive follow up calls for technical or commercial matters.
All calls may be recorded for quality assurance and training purposes. Please disconnect our calls and communicate only through emails if
you do not wish your conversations to be recorded.
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