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M Gmall Agib Majeed <viamed.aqib.majeed@gmail.com>

RE: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR PROFORMA MODIFICATION - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.

Christian Miro <christian.miro@medix.com.ar> 11 September 2023 at 13:41
To: "agib.majeed@viamed.co.uk" <aqib.majeed@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>, Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>, Andres Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>, Victoria Cerverizzo
<Victoria.Cerverizzo@medix.com.ar>, Comercio Exterior <ComEx@medix.com.ar>

Hi Aqib, how are you?

| need your help with this attached proforma:

PROFORMA:

We need you to change the invoice and delivery address as follows:

XIDEM MEDICAL LLC.

2330 PONCE DE LEON BLVD
CORAL GABLES, FL 33134, USA.
FEI NUMBER: 37-1975724.

PAYMENT:

We will make the payment for XIDEM surely on Monday; | need you to confirm the availability of the order as we need ASAP.

INVOICE:

| need that in the invoice the description says only Teledyne Sensor R-17; and the amount does not exceed USD 90 (we need this so we can use the door-to-door Courier
without problems).

SENT:
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:177674506855945874 3&simpl=msg-f:1776745068559458743&mb=1 1/22
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We will send the order directly to Paraguay by Courier, we will send you the account to coordinate; But it is mandatory that they use the invoice indicated in the previous point
for shipping.

Please we will wait for your comments, we need to confirm all this urgently.

Regards.

MEDICAL DEVICES

Christian Miro | Comprador Mercado Exterior
Christian.miro@medix.com.ar

+54 9 11 3323 2293

medix.com.ar

in]O)fw

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Luis Dominguez

Enviado el: jueves, 7 de septiembre de 2023 09:54

Para: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

CC: Andres Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR PROFORMA MODIFICATION - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.

Good day dear Ryan,
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My time to apologise for delay on reply, due also delay on reply from custom authority.

Please we need to ask you, to modify the nominated company on the Proforma Invoice, as follows (on Invoice Address):

To:
Company: XIDEM MEDICAL LLC.
Address: 2330 PONCE DE LEON BLVD

CORAL GABLES, FL 33134, USA.
FEI NUMBER: 37-1975724.

As per Payment terms: 100% Prepayment, the payment will be made through Xidem Medical LLC (our subsidiary in the USA).

The rest is ok.

Tks in advance for yr reply with PF modified.

Any questions, pls do not hesitate to ask.

Best rgds,

Luis Dominguez / Compras & Abastecimiento

celular: +54 9 11 3323-2319
email: luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar
medix.com.ar
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: miércoles, 30 de agosto de 2023 10:00

Para: Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>

CC: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>; Andres Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.

Dear Luis

| apologise for the late reply, as we have just had a national holiday.
Please find your proforma invoice attached.

Incoterm: EXW

Payment Terms: Prepayment

Currency: USD

Estimated ETD: The goods are available from stock and can be ready for dispatch within a couple of days from receipt of payment.
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* Origin of the items. - USA
* Commercial Brand of the items. - Teledyne

* Address of the factory for the pickup. - Viamed, 15 Station Road, Cross Hills, Keighley, West Yorkshire, BD20 7DT, United Kingdom

* MSDS if any item has battery. - no batteries
* Serial number of the items. - These will be listed on the final invoice

* Expiration date - It must be longer than 18 months. - There is no expiration date, but we recommend putting the sensors in to use within 6 months of purchase.

Please check all the address details, we have various details for you and so | am not sure which is correct. Please let me know if you have any questions or if there are any
amendments required.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 25 Aug 2023 at 20:44, Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar> wrote:
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Good afternoon dear Ryan,

Its all ok..., tks you very much for reply with Weight & dimensions ...!!

We received ok for the materials, so in order to comply with our customs regulations, please we need the following from you:

Documents needed:

* Proforma Invoice (with Incoterm, Payment Terms, Currency, Estimated ETD).

Information needed:

* Origin of the items.

* Commercial Brand of the items.

* Address of the factory for the pickup.
* MSDS if any item has battery.

* Serial number of the items.

* Expiration date - It must be longer than 18 months.

* LABEL INFORMATION MASTER BOX: origin - item number - commercial brand.

Pls confirm if you need any info/document from us.

Any questions, pls do not hesitate to ask.

Best rgds, and have a nice weekend...!!
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Luis Dominguez / Compras & Abastecimiento

celular: +54 9 11 3323-2319
email: luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar

medix.com.ar
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: viernes, 25 de agosto de 2023 11:43

Para: Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>

CC: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>; Andres Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.

Dear Luis

| apologise for the late reply.

120x R-17MED sensors (bulk packed):
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1x Box

61x47x25cm, 6.60kg

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 23 Aug 2023 at 18:11, Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar> wrote:
Good day dear Ryan,
In order to speed the formal PO here, pls kindly info the Cargo Details (weights, measures, and bulk shipping volume), for 120 units of yr R-17 MED (p/n 0110017).
Tks and best rgds.

Luis Dominguez /| Compras & Abastecimiento

celular: +54 9 11 3323-2319
email: luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar

medix.com.ar
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MEDICAL DEVICES

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: jueves, 17 de agosto de 2023 13:12

Para: Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.

Thank you very much for your help Luis

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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On Thu, 17 Aug 2023 at 17:01, Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Tks for yr confirmation about the availability of the material.

About the outstanding balance indicated, i'm sending yr query to Gonzalo from our accounting department, in order to revert to you with an answer asap.

Best rgds.

Luis Dominguez /| Compras & Abastecimiento

celular: +54 9 11 3323-2319
email: luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar
medix.com.ar
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Cuidamos lo mas importante
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui
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De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: jueves, 17 de agosto de 2023 12:44

Para: Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>

CC: viamedinbox@gmail.com; Andres Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: Re: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.

Dear Luis

Please can you do me a favour and speak with your accounts department, we still have an outstanding balance from a previous transaction, which will need to be
cleared before we can proceed with a new order. Please find a statement attached.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 17 Aug 2023 at 16:39, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Luis

We have the stock available. Once you are ready to proceed, we can send you a proforma invoice, then as soon as payment is received we will ship the sensors.

The sensors are always sealed in a labelled gas barrier bag, but you have the option of whether you would like each sensor also individually boxed. There is no
difference in cost, apart from the carriage charges would be lower if the sensors are bulk packed. Please just let us know when you place an order.
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Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 17 Aug 2023 at 16:14, Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar> wrote:

Good day dear Ryan,

Regarding this sensor code R-17MED (our part nbr. TE.C.43690), to be sent directly to Paraguay..., please confirm if you have stock of 120 units, for urgent
deliver.

If not, kindly confirm Etd since we confirm the PO.

Tks in advance for yr prompt reply.

Rgds.
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Luis Dominguez /| Compras & Abastecimiento

celular: +54 9 11 3323-2319
email: luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar

medix.com.ar
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as Importante

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Luis Dominguez
Enviado el: miércoles, 16 de agosto de 2023 11:12
Para: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

CC: viamedinbox@gmail.com; Andres Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>
Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.

Good day dear Ryan,

Tks you very much for yr help and confirmation...!!
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We’'ll give you all the detaills as soon we receive them fron Paraguay.

Rgds.

Luis Dominguez / Compras & Abastecimiento

celular: +54 9 11 3323-2319
email: luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar
medix.com.ar
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uidamos lo mas importante

Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: martes, 15 de agosto de 2023 11:35

Para: Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>

CC: viamedinbox@gmail.com; Andres Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.

Hi Luis
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No problem, we can send them to Paraguay for you, can you provide us with the delivery address, contact details and let us know what you need and we can put
a quotation together for you.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 15 Aug 2023 at 15:03, Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

We will shortly send you the corresponding purchase order for the sensors..., but we have a question to ask you.

Please, could you be able to send the order to Paraguay, instead of to Argentina...? These sensors belong to equipment going to Paraguay, and if you can

send them directly there, it will help us a lot, avoiding the scale in Argentina.

What would you need from us, besides the delivery address, and contact person...? Any additional documentation in particular...?
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Tks in advance for yr kind help and prompt reply.

Best rgds.

Luis Dominguez /| Compras & Abastecimiento

celular: +54 9 11 3323-2319
email: luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar
medix.com.ar
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Luis Dominguez
Enviado el: martes, 15 de agosto de 2023 10:10

Para: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk; viamedinbox@gmail.com
CC: Sebastian Ariel Torres <sebastian.torres@medix.com.ar>; Juan M. Romaris <juan.romaris@medix.com.ar>; Andres Daniel Tello

<andres.tello@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.

Good day dear Ryan,
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Tks you very much for the info/specifications, for the sensors offered.

We'll check them and revert to you asap.

Tks and best rgds.

Luis Dominguez / Compras & Abastecimiento

celular: +54 9 11 3323-2319
email: luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar
medix.com.ar
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: jueves, 10 de agosto de 2023 11:32

Para: Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>

CC: Juan M. Romaris <juan.romaris@medix.com.ar>; Andres Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.
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Dear Luis

You're very welcome. | have attached a copy of the specifications for each of the mentioned sensors.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 10 Aug 2023 at 14:26, Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Tks you very much for yr reply and alternatives offered.

We'll check them and revert to you asap.

Please keep us updated with the lead free options.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=07ddd72f30&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f:177674506855945874 3&simpl=msg-f:1776745068559458743&mb=1 18/22


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar

11/09/2023, 15:14 Gmail - RE: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR PROFORMA MODIFICATION - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.
Tks and best rgds.

Luis Dominguez /| Compras & Abastecimiento
celular: +54 9 11 3323-2319

email: luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar
medix.com.ar
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> En nombre de Ryan Swaine

Enviado el: jueves, 10 de agosto de 2023 05:24

Para: Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>

CC: Andres Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>; Juan M. Romaris <juan.romaris@medix.com.ar>

Asunto: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.

Dear Luis
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Thank you very much for your email.

The sensor you have purchased from us in the past is the R-17MED.

Although the R-17MED contains lead, it is still RoHS compliant, as there is an exemption on oxygen sensors for medical use.

R-17MED - pn. 0110017 = USD $43.10 each EXW (based on orders of 25+)

We can offer an alternative to the R-17MED which is more economical, which also contains lead, but is also RoHS compliant:

R-17Vi - pn. 0110019 = USD $32.50 each EXW

We are currently waiting on some lead free options that would be a direct replacement for the R-17MED and R-17Vi in the future. We are expecting to
receive some samples soon of the OOLMF103-1, we would be happy to make one available to you as soon as they are ready. | had already discussed this
in the past with your colleague Juan Manuel.

I look forward to your reply and please let me know if you have any further questions.

Kind regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Luis Dominguez <luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar>

Date: Wed, 9 Aug 2023 at 15:18

Subject: VIAMED LTD - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION PRODUCTION MATERIALS - PLANNING SECOND HALF 2023 - MEDIX S.R.L.

To: office@viamed.co.uk <office@viamed.co.uk>, orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>, info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Andres Daniel Tello <andres.tello@medix.com.ar>

Good morning dear Agib Majeed,

My name is Luis Dominguez, | am the new Buyer at Medix Argentina, and | will be in charge of the purchase of different items, among which are the
materials provided by you.

Code Description Qtty

TE.C.43690 Celda R17 (RoHS) UL 112

Please, we would need your best Quote for the following materials and their respective quantities, necessary to comply with the production planning til
the end of the year.

Please kindly also confirm Cargo Details (measurements, weights, and qtty of Packages), Estimated Delivery Date, and Method of Payment.

Thank you very much in advance for your attention and prompt reply.

Kind regards.
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Luis Dominguez / Compras & Abastecimiento

celular: +54 9 11 3323-2319
email: luis.dominguez@medix.com.ar

medix.com.ar

MEDICAL DEVICES

Cuidamos lo mas importante
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Para conocer mas de nosotros presione aqui

ﬂ MVM145332 PROFORMA VIAMED - XIDEM.pdf
88K
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