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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

AW: Xylem WEDECO Purchase Order BE373093
1 message

Gensch, Thomas - Xylem <Thomas.Gensch@xylem.com> 7 September 2023 at 10:49
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate,

 

I have adjusted the price to 45,70€ in our system.

 

UPS account 713240 is correct.

 

Please proceed with our order.

 

Thank you.

 

Mit freundlichen Grüßen / Best regards

 

i.A. Thomas Gensch

Purchasing Department

 

Xylem Water Solutions Herford GmbH

Boschstr. 4 – 14,

32051 Herford, Germany

 

Phone: +49 5221 930-135

E-Mail: Thomas.Gensch@xylem.com

 

 

linkedin  |  twitter  |  facebook   |  youtube  |  instagram

 

Geschäftsführer / MD: Kahlid Al Barim
Amtsgericht Bad Oeynhausen HRB 11550

mailto:Thomas.Gensch@xylem.com
https://www.xylem.com/en-us
https://www.linkedin.com/company/xylem-inc-/mycompany/
https://twitter.com/XylemInc
https://www.facebook.com/XylemIncorporated/
https://www.youtube.com/user/XylemIncorporated
https://www.instagram.com/xylem_inc/
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Sitz der Gesellschaft / located at:
Boschstraße 4-14, 32051 Herford, Germany

 

Denken Sie an die Umwelt, bevor Sie diese E-Mail drucken | Save Paper! Think Before You Print !

P Wirklich drucken? Sparen Sie pro Seite 250 ml Wasser, 5 g CO2, 15 g Holz und 50 Wh Energie!

 

Von: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Im Auftrag von Kate Griffiths
Gesendet: Mittwoch, 6. September 2023 16:27
An: Business Gateway - Xylem <svc-DEHRD1-BizGate@xylem.com>; automatische Bestellungen
<res_DEHRD1.Best@xylem.com>; Gensch, Thomas - Xylem <Thomas.Gensch@xylem.com>
Betreff: Re: Xylem WEDECO Purchase Order BE373093

 

Good afternoon, Thank you for your order BE373093. Please could I advise you that the correct price of part number 0110017 - R-17MED is €45. 70 each? I have attached a price list. I have used your UPS account 713240 for shipping. Please let me

Good afternoon,

 

Thank you for your order BE373093.

 

Please could I advise you that the correct price of part number 0110017 - R-17MED is  €45.70 each?  I have attached
a price list.  

 

I have used your UPS account 713240 for shipping.

 

Please let me know if you would like me to proceed.

 

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Wed, 6 Sept 2023 at 15:21, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Business Gateway - Xylem <svc-DEHRD1-BizGate@xylem.com>
Date: Wed, 6 Sept 2023 at 14:55
Subject: Xylem WEDECO Purchase Order BE373093
To: export@viamed.co.uk <export@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: automatische Bestellungen <res_DEHRD1.Best@xylem.com>

 

Dear Sir or Madame,
Attached you will receive our purchase order BE373093
Please let us have an order confirmation immediately.
For further questions please contact the person named in the cover letter.
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This e-mail, including any attachments and/or linked documents, is intended for the
sole use of the intended addressee and may contain information that is privileged, confidential, proprietary, or
otherwise protected by law. Any unauthorized review, dissemination, distribution, or copying is prohibited. If you
have received this communication in error, please contact the original sender immediately by reply email and
destroy all copies of the original message and any attachments. Please note that any views or opinions presented
in this e-mail are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of Xylem Inc..
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