05/09/2023, 11:37 Gmail - RE: Order VANWEB1791 confirmed

M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: Order VANWEB1791 confirmed

1 message

Diving <diving@scubashack.co.uk> 5 September 2023 at 11:05
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Thanks Ryan

Can | please order 3 x R-22VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110232)

No problem to pay pro- forma if you could send the invoice and bacs details through.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Monday, September 4, 2023 1:06 PM

To: Diving <diving@scubashack.co.uk>

Subject: Re: Order VANWEB1791 confirmed

Hi Jonah
Yes, we would be happy to offer you a trade account, | can see you are a retailer.

Please find some information and our trade/retail pricing attached. We do not impose any minimum order quantities,
we would only ask that your first few orders are prepaid by either bank transfer or credit/debit card.

| have amended the account we have the system for you, so you are free to order whenever is convenient for you.
Please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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On Thu, 31 Aug 2023 at 10:35, Diving <diving@scubashack.co.uk> wrote:

Hi

Do you do trade accounts?

We are a dive center and need to order more of the same below?
Thanks in advance

Jonah

From: Vandagraph <info@vandagraph.co.uk>
Sent: Thursday, May 25, 2023 4:11 PM

To: Diving <diving@scubashack.co.uk>
Subject: Order VANWEB1791 confirmed

& VANDAGRAPH LTD ,.&%

Thank you for your purchase!

Hi Philip, we're getting your order ready to be shipped. We will notify you
when it has been sent. We shall be in touch should there be any issues with
stock availability.

or Visit our store

Order summary
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R-22VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110232) x 2

Subtotal

Shipping

Taxes

Total

Customer information

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1775736731129222513%7Cmsg-f:1776191626494381...

£100.00

£100.00

£6.00

£21.20

£127.20 GBP
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Shipping address Billing address

Philip Jones Philip Jones

Scuba Shack Limited Scuba Shack Limited
Bilston Street Bilston Street

Scuba Shack Scuba Shack

Dudley DY3 1JB Dudley DY3 1JB
United Kingdom United Kingdom
Shipping method Payment method
Standard € ending with 1865

If you have any questions, reply to this email or contact us at info@vandagraph.co.uk
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