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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: order
1 message

Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl> 29 August 2023 at 14:34
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

please include the quick ox too, din kits not needed...

Thanks Ryan!

Met vriendelijke groet / Kind regards,

Eddy van Vliet -  Scuba Support 

Franciscusweg 10-1
1216SK Hilversum
The Netherlands
Openingstijden
Phone: +31 648511848            Info@ScubaSupport.nl
Fax:     +31 84-8307700           www.ScubaSupport.nl
________________________________________________

KvK:321167830000                      VAT#  NL001959467B52

EORI Nr: NL5181168523

Bank Account: Multicorp 

IBAN: NL30 RABO 0123851734 - BIC: RABONL2U

The Netherlands

Op di 29 aug 2023 om 15:00 schreef Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>:
Hi Eddy

Thank you very much for your order.

I have added the VN202 as a device with sensor only, please let me know if you need me to add Quick-Ox or
DinKits for them.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 29 Aug 2023 at 13:50, Scuba Support - Eddy van Vliet <info@scubasupport.nl> wrote:
Hey Ryan, I would like to order 
8x R33de
2x R17van
1x Tekox
2x VN202 analyser

Thanks!
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