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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

confirmation of order
1 message

Sharon Ng <sharon@trim-systems.com.sg> 23 August 2023 at 13:41
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: james@trim-systems.com.sg, Hui Hui <huihui@trim-systems.com.sg>, Moe Yi <moeyi@trim-systems.com.sg>

Dear Ryan,

Thank you for your quotation. We are pleased to confirm our order for the following:

1) 6pcs R-33VAN (RP) Oxygen sensor (0110239) = GBP £40 each
2) 6pcs MAX-250E Oxygen sensor (0110429) = GBP £59 each

Kindly acknowledge upon receiving our order and  scan us your invoice and banker’s details for payment
arrangement.

Thank you.

With Best Regards,
Sharon Ng
Trim Systems Pte Ltd

On 23 Aug 2023, at 7:15 PM, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Sharon

Thank you for your email.

We have the sensors listed available from stock:
R-33VAN (RP) = GBP £40 each
MAX-250E = GBP £59 each

Please find the documents you requested attached. Please just let us know if you have any questions
or if you would like to proceed with the order.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 23 Aug 2023 at 07:33, <sharon@trim-systems.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

 

Good day to you.
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We would appreciate if you could advise price and stock availability/lead time required for the
following:

 

1) 8pcs                 R-33VAN (RP) Oxygen Sensor (0110239)

2) 6pcs                 MAX-250E Oxygen Sensor (0110429)

 

Please provide Declaration of Conformities and Specifications for the above.

 

Thank you.

 

With Best Regards

Sharon Ng

Trim Systems Pte Ltd

11 Tuas South Link 1

#03-12/13/14 Shine@Tuas South

Singapore 636901

Tel: 6266 4566

Business Hrs: Monday to Friday 8:30am to 5:30pm (collection/delivery after 9:00am but before 5:00pm)

 

 

4 attachments

0110239 R-33VAN-RP Specification Datasheet v1.0 2022-09-22.pdf
156K

DOC - R-33VAN-RP - 220922.pdf
548K

MAX-250 Series Specifications ID14384.pdf
146K

QR-0002 Rev19_signed.pdf
70K
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