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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Info
1 message

Italgoods <info@italgoods.com> 19 August 2023 at 09:59
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hi Ryan,
I order 4 r17van and 4 r41v
Please prepare the invoice so that I can do a transfer also of the old invoice together.
Thank You

Il giorno 18 ago 2023, alle ore 10:35, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> ha scritto:

Hi Guido

Our R-17VAN would be a suitable replacement.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Italgoods <info@italgoods.com>
Date: Fri, 18 Aug 2023 at 07:01
Subject: Info
To: Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Ryan!
Do you have the sensor for the Goel 370?
Thank You
Guido
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