17/08/2023, 14:44 Gmail - RE: Envitec O2 Sensor

M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: Envitec O2 Sensor

1 message

Ramel Fernandez <sales@chambersoceanicsfzc.com> 17 August 2023 at 14:41
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Cc: sheldon@chambersoceanicsfzc.com, john@chambersoceanicsfzc.com, shiva@chambersoceanicsfzc.com,
anil@chambersoceanicsfzc.com, accounts@chambersoceanicsfzc.com

Dear Ryan,

Thanks for the price validation and its availability.

We confirmed 10Nos. to place in order, as well please send your Proforma Invoice.

(P

’ ‘ Ramel Fernandez
ﬁ’# Sales Coordinator
i ‘%J CHAMBERS OCEANICS FZC

%, +97158 5896999, +971 4 5800112

B4 sales@chambersoceanicsfze.com

© W360 Dubai Maritime City, Near Dubai Drydocks Dubai, UAE

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They are intended for the named recipient(s) only. If
you have received this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not disclose the contents to anyone or make
copies thereof.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine

Sent: Thursday, 17 August 2023 5:17 PM

To: Ramel Fernandez <sales@chambersoceanicsfzc.com>

Cc: sheldon@chambersoceanicsfzc.com; john@chambersoceanicsfzc.com; shiva@chambersoceanicsfzc.com
Subject: Re: Envitec O2 Sensor
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17/08/2023, 14:44 Gmail - RE: Envitec O2 Sensor

Dear Ramel
I'm very well, thank you. | hope you are too.

OOM111 = GBP £63 each EXW

We have 14 available from stock, but we can get more within a few days. If you can let me know how many you
are looking for | can give you an accurate ETA.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 17 Aug 2023 at 13:29, Ramel Fernandez <sales@chambersoceanicsfzc.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
Good day, hope all is well.

Further to below quotation, kindly update the validity and availability of this item. Thanks.

Appreciate your prompt response

(P
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17/08/2023, 14:44 Gmail - RE: Envitec O2 Sensor
r ‘ Ramel Fernandez
) Sales Coordinator
' 9! ‘ CHAMBERS OCEANICS FZC

% +971 58 5896999, +971 4 5800112

t4 sales@chambersoceanicsfzc.com

@ W360 Dubai Maritime City, Near Dubai Drydocks Dubai, UAE

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They are intended for the named recipient(s) only. If
you have received this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not disclose the contents to anyone or make
copies thereof.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine

Sent: Thursday, 27 July 2023 12:04 PM

To: Ramel Fernandez <sales@chambersoceanicsfzc.com>

Cc: sheldon@chambersoceanicsfzc.com; john@chambersoceanicsfzc.com; shiva@chambersoceanicsfzc.com
Subject: Re: Envitec O2 Sensor

Dear Ramel

Thank you very much for your email.

The trade price for the OOM111 is GBP £63 each EXW and we have the sensors available from stock.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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17/08/2023, 14:44 Gmail - RE: Envitec O2 Sensor

On Thu, 27 Jul 2023 at 08:20, Ramel Fernandez <sales@chambersoceanicsfzc.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan,

Good day, hope all is well.

Kindly advise the availability of below at its best price.

1. ENVITEC Medical 02 Sensor OOM111 — 10Nos

Appreciate your prompt response, thanks.

r ‘ Ramel Fernandez
_ﬁ' i Sales Coordinator
i !a CHAMBERS OCEANICS FZC

%, +97158 5896999, +971 4 5800112

B4 sales@chambersoceanicsfzc.com

© W360 Dubai Maritime City, Near Dubai Drydocks Dubai, UAE

IMPORTANT: The contents of this email and any attachments are confidential. They are intended for the named recipient(s) only. If
you have received this email by mistake, please notify the sender immediately and do not disclose the contents to anyone or make

copies thereof.
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