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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Oxygen Sensor Itg M-03
1 message

Biomedical Department <biomedical@nduhospital.com> 10 August 2023 at 11:28
To: kategriffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: office <office@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

please send me a quotation document adding the shipment price to Lebanon for 11 sensors, as well as the lead
time.

Contact details:

Department: Biomedical
Company Name: Lebanese Healthcare Management (L.H.M) S.A.L
VAT Registration: 3755041
Address:
Sarba, Keserwan, Lebanon,
President Chehab Street, Notre Dame Hospital Building, Floor: 0
Email: biomedical@nduhospital.com
Phone Number: +96109644644
Thank you!

Regards,
Biomedical Department
Email: biomedical@nduhospital.com

Tel. +961 9 644644; ext. 8166

---- On Wed, 09 Aug 2023 16:55:44 +0300 Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote ---

Good afternoon,

Thank you for your enquiry.

The equivalent part number we can supply is 0110041 -  oxygen sensor R-41V, please see attached technical 
specification.

The price breaks are as follows:

1 = $ 63.50 2 = $ 57.15 each EXW 3-10 = $ 53.98 each EXW 11 or more = $ 50.80 each EXW

This sensor is currently in stock.

If you would like a proforma invoice, valid for 30 days, I would need your delivery and invoice addresses in order to
set up a new account for you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Wed, 9 Aug 2023 at 12:25, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Biomedical Department <biomedical@nduhospital.com>
Date: Wed, 9 Aug 2023 at 12:14
Subject: Oxygen Sensor Itg M-03
To: info <info@viamed.co.uk>

Hello,

I need to order oxygen sensor Itg M-03 for my ventilator.
Is this item available at your store? or a compatible one?
If so, Do you ship to Lebanon?
kindly provide us with full price details as well as lead time.
Regards,
Biomedical Department
Email: biomedical@nduhospital.com

Tel. +961 9 644644; ext. 8166
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