
01/08/2023, 13:57 Gmail - Re: Gas analyzer

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1772651294417849188%7Cmsg-f:1773027578338494… 1/6

Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Gas analyzer
1 message

Yavor Paunov <manager@underwatertg.com> 1 August 2023 at 12:54
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hello Ryan,

Thank you very much for your understanding.
As I made the payment on the first invoice yesterday, today I did a new one only for the additional cell.

New shipping address:

Vencislav Venkov

str. Dimcho Debelyanov 14, Et.5, Ap. 13
Varna 9000
Bulgaria

+359893543487

Best Regards
Yavor Paunov

Underwater Technicians Group Ltd.
Founder / CEO
Mail: manager@underwatertg.com
Tel: +359 898488475

On Tue, Aug 1, 2023 at 12:24 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Yavor

Please find your amended proforma invoice attached.

Please let me know if it is okay or if it requires any changes.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 1 Aug 2023 at 09:23, Yavor Paunov <manager@underwatertg.com> wrote:
Good morning Ryan,

May I add one more cell and change the delivery address. My colleague got a call to travel offshore?
The cell we need to add si:

1. 0110217 R-17VAN (VN202, TEK-OX, Miniox, MD300, AD300, Nuvair 9506, GOEL 370) - 1pcs

Best Regards
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Yavor Paunov

Underwater Technicians Group Ltd.
Founder / CEO
Mail: manager@underwatertg.com
Tel: +359 898488475

On Mon, Jul 31, 2023 at 3:44 PM Yavor Paunov <manager@underwatertg.com> wrote:
Hello Ryan,

I made the payment, you should receive It in 2-3 working days.

Best Regards
Yavor Paunov

Underwater Technicians Group Ltd.
Founder / CEO
Mail: manager@underwatertg.com
Tel: +359 898488475

On Mon, Jul 31, 2023 at 2:25 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Yavor

No problem at all, please find your amended invoice attached.

Please let me know when you have made the payment.

Thank you, Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 31 Jul 2023 at 12:13, Yavor Paunov <manager@underwatertg.com> wrote:
Hello Ryan,

I apologize, could you add:

9790002 Practise of O2 Measurement - Edition 2 (inc. Edition 1) - 3pcs

Other than that we can proceed and I will pay the proforma invoice at the same day.

Best Regards
Yavor Paunov

Underwater Technicians Group Ltd.
Founder / CEO
Mail: manager@underwatertg.com
Tel: +359 898488475
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On Mon, Jul 31, 2023 at 1:45 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Yavor

Thank you very much. Please find your proforma invoice attached.

Please let me know if it requires any amendments or if you are happy to proceed, our banking details
are listed at the bottom of the invoice.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 31 Jul 2023 at 10:04, Yavor Paunov <manager@underwatertg.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,

Thank you very much for you reply, we are ready to post an order for the items below:

1. 7910110 VN202 mkII Oxygen Analyser (inc. Sensor) - Manual switch-off - 2pcs
2. 7910111 VN202 mkII Oxygen Analyser (inc. Sensor/Quick-Ox) - Manual switch-off - 1pcs
3. Oxygen Concentrator Adapter Cap (0120120) - 2pcs
4. 0110224 R-33DE (Analox O2EII, O2EII Pro, 9100-9220-9B) - 2pcs
5. 0110232 R-22VAN (Oxyspy) - 1pcs

Invoice details:

Underwater Technicians Group Ltd.
VAT:BG201002166

Herson 4
Shumen 9700
Bulgaria
Yavor Paunov

Shipping details:

Kiril Panov
Karamfil 10, Et. 6, Ap. 13
Varna 9000
Bulgaria
+359886433013

*I am offshore in the German sector at the moment, so one of my employees will receive the order.

Best Regards
Yavor Paunov

Underwater Technicians Group Ltd.
Founder / CEO
Mail: manager@underwatertg.com
Tel: +359 898488475
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On Mon, Jul 31, 2023 at 11:42 AM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Yavor

Thank you for your email.

The sensor you require for Divesoft is our R-22VAN.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Sat, 29 Jul 2023 at 08:30, Yavor Paunov <manager@underwatertg.com> wrote:
Hello Ryan,

Thank you very much for your cooperation!

I spoke with the dive centers I am working with and next week we will post a larger order,
including oxygen cells and maybe at least one more analyser.
Do you have replacement for this cell:

https://eshop.divesoft.com/bg/analyzer-utilities/oxygen-sensor-divesoft-22s/3001

Best Regards
Yavor Paunov

Underwater Technicians Group Ltd.
Founder / CEO
Mail: manager@underwatertg.com
Tel: +359 898488475

On Fri, Jul 28, 2023 at 1:20 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Yavor

Thank you very much. We would be happy to supply you on a trade basis, please find our
trade and retail price lists and some product information attached. 
Although most of our business is with the recreational area, we do supply quite a lot of sensors
into the commercial industry, such as our R-33VAN-2 and R-33VAN-4 sensors, so please keep
us in mind if you ever have any enquiries for sensors.

VN202 (manual off) - 7910110 = GBP £120 each EXW
Oxygen Concentrator Adapter = GBP £6 each EXW

If you would like to proceed with an order, please provide me with your complete company
address (Billing and Delivery), VAT number, EORI number and I will send you a proforma
invoice which can be paid by either bank transfer or credit card. 
As soon as payment is received we would dispatch your order from our UK based warehouse.

mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:manager@underwatertg.com
https://eshop.divesoft.com/bg/analyzer-utilities/oxygen-sensor-divesoft-22s/3001
mailto:manager@underwatertg.com
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk


01/08/2023, 13:57 Gmail - Re: Gas analyzer

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1772651294417849188%7Cmsg-f:1773027578338494… 5/6

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 28 Jul 2023 at 10:57, Yavor Paunov <manager@underwatertg.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,

Thank you very much for your quick response!

Our company is specialised in commercial diving service and supplying of commercial and
recreational diving equipment. 
Those gas analyzers will be delivered to one of the commercial diving companies at home
(Bulgaria) and will be ordered by our company, as we will supply more equipment like a dive
panel, communication and etc. 

Best Regards
Yavor Paunov

Underwater Technicians Group Ltd.
Founder / CEO
Mail: manager@underwatertg.com
Tel: +359 898488475

On Fri, Jul 28, 2023 at 12:49 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Yavor

Thank you very much for your email.

Before I send you the pricing information, please can you let me know more about your
company?

Are you intending on purchasing the device and reselling to your clients or are they going
to source the device directly?

I look forward to your reply.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 28 Jul 2023 at 09:13, Yavor Paunov <manager@underwatertg.com> wrote:
Dear Sirs,
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One of our clients is looking for price and delivery time for:

1. VN202 mkII Diving Analyser - Non Auto-Switch off (7910110) - 2pcs
2. Oxygen Concentrator Adapter Cap - 2pcs

Delivery address will be in Bulgaria.
Could you please send some details to me and I will forward It to our customer for
proofing the order.
Thank you very much in advance!

Best Regards
Yavor Paunov

Underwater Technicians Group Ltd.
Founder / CEO
Mail: manager@underwatertg.com
Tel: +359 898488475
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