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Re: Gas analyzer Inbox × Vandagraph ×

to ryan.swaine

Yavor Paunov

Good morning Ryan,

May I add one more cell and change the delivery address. My colleague got a call to travel offshore?
The cell we need to add si:

1. 0110217 R-17VAN (VN202, TEK-OX, Miniox, MD300, AD300, Nuvair 9506, GOEL 370) - 1pcs

Best Regards
Yavor Paunov

Underwater Technicians Group Ltd.
Founder / CEO
Mail: manager@underwatertg.com
Tel: +359 898488475

On Mon, Jul 31, 2023 at 3:44 PM Yavor Paunov <manager@underwatertg.com> wrote:
Hello Ryan,

I made the payment, you should receive It in 2-3 working days.

Best Regards
Yavor Paunov
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