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From: medquip Itd <lidmedquip@gmail.com=
Date: Wed, 26 Jul 2023 at 14:00

Subject: Re: Reqguest for quote- Analyzer

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan.
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Hope you are doing well.
Kindly confirm we need you to send us those sensors and one pc venturi blender code 0310228,
Send us a proforma invoice and hs codes.

On Thu, Jul 13, 2023 at 5:07 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Albert

The sensor pricing is still correct. If you are still interested in the MaxVenturi, please let me know which model and we will check the pr

Rest renards



