26/07/2023, 16:21 Gmail - Fwd: Quotation

M G ma |I Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Fwd: Quotation

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
To: Janine Gill <janine.gill@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 26 Jul 2023 at 16:11

Subject: Re: Quotation

To: Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Janine,

| am sorry, we need only 5 boxes (25 sensors)
Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates

Sri Lanka.

On Wed, Jul 26, 2023, 8:27 PM Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello,

The price for 4310002 is:

26 July 2023 at 16:19

1-4=£136.00 [l5-9=£82.00 [[10-24=£75.00 [][25 or more = £ 68.50

Please inform me if you would like to go ahead with the order.

Kind regards
Janine Gill

Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-a:r-432297290147274621&simpl=msg-a:r-432297290147274621&mb=1
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 26 Jul 2023 at 15:49, Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi Janine,

Thank you for the proforma invoice

Can you double check Flow sensor pricing?
Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Wed, Jul 26, 2023, 4:37 PM Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hello Sudath,
Thank you for getting back to me.
Please find the proforma attached as requested.
If you are happy to proceed please let me know then | can turn it into an order.

If you need anything changing please let me know.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-a:r-432297290147274621&simpl=msg-a:r-432297290147274621&mb=1 2/5
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Kind regards

Janine Gill
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

Itis intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 26 Jul 2023 at 11:27, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com>

Date: Wed, 26 Jul 2023 at 11:24

Subject: Re: Quotation

To: Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk>

Good morning Janine,

Thank you for your email,

Can you send proforma invoice for above products use shipping Skycargo express ?

Payment GBP through PayPal

Best regards,
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Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Wed, Jul 26, 2023, 3:41 PM Janine Gill <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=22eb7d1d9a&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-a:r-432297290147274621&simpl=msg-a:r-432297290147274621&mb=1

Good Morning,
Thank you for your email.
We currently have stock on items

4310002 - Flowsensor - Autoclavable.
0110042 - Oxygen Sensor R-42V.

Please let me know if you need any other info.

Kind regards

Janine Gill
Office Administrator
Viamed Ltd.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: janine.gill@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634 542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635 582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

Gmail - Fwd: Quotation

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be

unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535

634542
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On Wed, 26 Jul 2023 at 11:08, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 26 Jul 2023 at 11:00

Subject: Fwd: Quotation

To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, Jul 25, 2023, 7:34 PM

Subject: Quotation

To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Good Morning Kate,

Stocks are available 25 Pcs Flow sensors (7030131001 Autoclavable) and 05 Pcs R-42V (Stephan)
Thank you,

Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.
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