24/07/2023, 17:49 Gmail - Re: ORDER

M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>
Re: ORDER

1 message

Yann Ségalou <yann@segytek.com> 24 July 2023 at 17:37

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

CB (carte bancaire) = CC :0)

Ségytek

Quai du cordon bleu

44100 Nantes

France

Tel : +33 2 40 95 61 26

e-mail : yann@segytek.com

Site <www.segytek.com>
https://www.facebook.com/Segytek/?ref=bookmarks

> Le 24 juil. 2023 a 18:33, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :
>

> Hi Yann

>

> Thank you.
>

> What do you mean by CB?

>

> Best regards

> Ryan

>

>

> Ryan Swaine

> General Manager

> VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

> http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
> Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
> Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

> Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

>

>

> On Mon, 24 Jul 2023 at 17:29, Yann Ségalou <yann@segytek.com> wrote:
> Dear Ryan,

>

> Thank you for your answer,

>

> Yes I'm OK with this invoice.

>

> You can use my CB for payment
>

> Best regards

>

> Yann Ségalou

>

> Ségytek

> Quai du cordon bleu

> 44100 Nantes

> France

> Tel : +33 2 40 95 61 26

> e-mail : yann@segytek.com

> Site <www.segytek.com>

> https://www.facebook.com/Segytek/?ref=bookmarks
>

> > Le 24 juil. 2023 a 18:26, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> a écrit :
> >
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24/07/2023, 17:49 Gmail - Re: ORDER

> > Dear Yann

> >

> > Please find your proforma invoice attached, | have added the carriage by UPS Express which takes only 1-2
days. Please let me know if you are happy to proceed and | will ask our warehouse to make an immediate dispatch.
> >

> > Please let me know if you would also like us to use the CC details from your last order?

> >

> > Best regards

> > Ryan

> >

> >

> > Ryan Swaine

> > General Manager

> > VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

> > http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

> > Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

> > Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

> > Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

> >

> >

> > e Forwarded message ---------

> > From: Yann Ségalou <yann@segytek.com>

> > Date: Mon, 24 Jul 2023, 13:59

> > Subject: ORDER

> > To: Michael Lamb <office@viamed.co.uk>

> >

> >

> > Dear Michael,

> >

> > |s it possible to send me this order quickly enough for me to receive it before the end of the week (I'm closed next
week)?

> >

> > This is my new order:

> >

> > Quantity item

> >

> > 1 Tek-Ox with Quick Ox (Auto Switch-Off) (7910201)
> >

> > 4 R-17VAN oxygen sensor for VN202
> >

> >

> > Best regards

> >

> > Yann Ségalou

> >

> > Ségytek

> > Quai du cordon bleu

> > 44100 Nantes

> > France

>>Tel: +33 240 95 61 26

> > e-mail : yann@segytek.com

> > Site <www.segytek.com>

> > https://www.facebook.com/Segytek/?ref=bookmarks
> > <MAN144711.pdf>

>

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1772314286438393248%7Cmsg-f:1772320630088776... 2/2


http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:yann@segytek.com
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:yann@segytek.com
http://www.segytek.com/
https://www.facebook.com/Segytek/?ref=bookmarks

