24/07/2023, 15:09 Gmail - Re:

M Gma” Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>
Re:

1 message

Mahesh Patil <dr.maheshpatil5716@gmail.com> Mon, Jul 24, 2023 at 1:22 PM

To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Hello

Please give best price possible.
Dr.Mahesh Patil

Precision Healthcare Calibration Services.

Shivam Gandhi Vikas Nagar Lane no 1
Kabnoor. Ichalkaranji. 416115

Dist Kolhapur State Maharashtra India.
Mob +91 9665134801

On Mon, 24 Jul 2023, 13:47 Sophie Lines, <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning,

Thank you for your reply.
| can confirm the price for the V1000 Foetal Heart Simulator (part number 1410000) is $950 EXW.

If you would like me to send you an official quote, along with delivery costs to you in India, please let me know your
full details including delivery and invoice address

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main office
will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Fri, Jul 21, 2023 at 5:02 PM Mahesh Patil <dr.maheshpatil5716@gmail.com> wrote:
Ok.
Please share Quotation for the same.
Thanks & Regards

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d 104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1772026356938037719%7Cmsg-f:1772304611805224... 1/2


https://www.google.com/maps/search/Gandhi+Vikas+Nagar+Lane+no+1?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:dr.maheshpatil5716@gmail.com

24/07/2023, 15:09 Gmail - Re:

On Fri, 21 Jul 2023, 20:35 Sophie Lines, <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good afternoon,

Thank you for your inquiry. You are welcome to purchase this item from us directly if you would prefer to do so,
please let me know.

Kind regards
Sophie Lines
Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone calls to the main
office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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and may be unlawful.
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On Fri, Jul 21, 2023 at 11:40 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Mahesh Patil <dr.maheshpatil5716@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, 21 Jul 2023 at 11:36

Subject:

To: <distributors@viamed.co.uk>

Can you please share Distributor contact info in India for product Viamed Doppler stimulator model 1000.
Thank you
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