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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: RFQ: PART FOR VENTILATOR; MFR:AEONMED; MODEL:VG 70:
1 message

Bibi_Jose@hospinorm.com <Bibi_Jose@hospinorm.com> 7 July 2023 at 05:15
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Cc: Iftekhar_Chougle@gulfdrug.com

Dear Kate,

Can you please send the official quotation.

Thanks & Regards,

Bibi Jose

Project Coordinator-Hospinorm Fujairah - EHS

Hospinorm Maintenance Management A Subsidiary of Gulf Drug LLC

Dibba Hospital (Emirates Heath Services)
Phone: +971 9 2441549

Email:bibi_jose@hospinorm.com

 
DISCLAIMER:This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to
whom they are addressed. If you are not the named addressee, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this email.  Please notify the
sender immediately by email if you have received this email by mistake and delete this email from your system.  Please note that any views
or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the organization. Finally,
Computer viruses can be transmitted via email.  The recipient should check this email and any attachments for the presence of viruses. The
organization accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.  Email transmission cannot be guaranteed to
be secure or error-free, as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The
sender, therefore, does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message which arise as a result of email

transmission.

-----"Main Account" <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote: -----
To: Bibi_Jose@hospinorm.com
From: "Kate Griffiths"
Sent by: "Main Account"
Date: 07/06/2023 12:45PM
Cc: sales@viamed.co.uk, Reju_Mathew@gulfdrug.com, Majed_sider@gulfdrug.co.ae,
Iftekhar_Chougle@gulfdrug.com, Nisha_Azeef@gulfdrug.com, Shine_Koshy@hospinorm.com
Subject: Re: RFQ: PART FOR VENTILATOR; MFR:AEONMED; MODEL:VG 70:

This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Good morning,

Thank you for your email.

The price of part number 0110021 - R-22MEDV is $37.75 each EXW.  These are currently in stock.

Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice in order to make payment or a quotation instead.

Many thanks.
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Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
-----------------
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Thu, 6 Jul 2023 at 09:21, <Bibi_Jose@hospinorm.com> wrote:
Good Day.

Please quote your best price for the below mentioned part as per the specifications provided:

FOR PART FOR VENTILATOR; MFR:AEONMED; MODEL:VG 70:

Part Required:

1. O2 SENSOR FOR AEONMED R- 22 MEDV; PART NO: 0110021;QTY: 3 PC;

Your earliest reply will be highly appreciated.

Thanks & Regards,

Bibi Jose

Project Coordinator-Hospinorm Fujairah - EHS

Hospinorm Maintenance Management A Subsidiary of Gulf Drug LLC

Dibba Hospital (Emirates Heath Services)
Phone: +971 9 2441549

Email:bibi_jose@hospinorm.com

 
DISCLAIMER:This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity
to whom they are addressed. If you are not the named addressee, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this email.  Please
notify the sender immediately by email if you have received this email by mistake and delete this email from your system.   Please
note that any views or opinions presented in this email are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of the
organization. Finally, Computer viruses can be transmitted via email.  The recipient should check this email and any attachments for
the presence of viruses. The organization accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this email.   Email
transmission cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free, as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive
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late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender, therefore, does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of

this message which arise as a result of email transmission.

Disclaimer

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the
recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure,
copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful.

Disclaimer

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by the recipient
and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying,
distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.


