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Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: P.O.20111-23
1 message

Nivaco Info <info@nivaco.gr> 6 July 2023 at 11:35
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk, kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Cc: NIVACO ACCOUNTING <acc@nivaco.gr>, Nivaco Sales <sales@nivaco.gr>, Nick Vardatsikos <nv@nivaco.gr>

Dear Ryan,
As we have a "last time" request from a customer please increase the quantity of code:R-30V(0110040) from 3 pcs to
5pcs and send us your revised P.I.
Looking forward to your reply,

Kind regards,

Mary Kritikou |
t: +30 2108069726, +30 2106142506
e: info@nivaco.gr
w: www.nivaco.gr
a: 2 Evvias str. Marousi 15125, Greece

On Tue, Jul 4, 2023 at 4:11 PM Nick Vardatsikos <nv@nivaco.gr> wrote:
Dear Ryan.
It will be convenient for our accounting purposes  to pay one total invoice including the duties.
Please issue an invoice with duties included when you ship the goods and inform your accounts director that we
will pay immediately.

Since it is your first time shipping DDP, someone at VIAMED has to monitor this procedure closely. 

Hoping to have the goods here  before July's end.

Regards
Nick 
 
Nikolaos C. Vardatsikos
t: +30 2108069726 | m: +30 6932410902
e: nv@nivaco.gr
w: www.nivaco.gr
a: 2 Evvias str. Marousi 15125, Greece

On Tue, Jul 4, 2023 at 12:29 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Nick

Your account is set up as prepayment by proforma. If it is going to be a problem, I can speak with our accounts
director.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED

tel:+30%2021%200806%209726
tel:+30%2021%200614%202506
mailto:info@nivaco.gr
http://www.nivaco.gr/
mailto:nv@nivaco.gr
mailto:nv@nivaco.gr
http://www.nivaco.gr/
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk


06/07/2023, 13:12 Gmail - Re: P.O.20111-23

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=7e81c75fe0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1770143641815476533%7Cmsg-f:1770667156179989… 2/3

www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117
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On Tue, 4 Jul 2023 at 09:13, Nick Vardatsikos <nv@nivaco.gr> wrote:
Dear Kate and Ryan.
 
Please inform, whether the  terms of  payment are on delivery, or prepayment.
On delivery will enable us to add to our payment of the invoice together with the duties payable  on DDP.

Also please inform  us of the delivery date.

Best Regards
Nick  

Nikolaos C. Vardatsikos
t: +30 2108069726 | m: +30 6932410902
e: nv@nivaco.gr
w: www.nivaco.gr
a: 2 Evvias str. Marousi 15125, Greece

On Mon, Jul 3, 2023 at 5:10 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Nick

Thank you very much for your order, please find your amended proforma invoice attached.

As I mentioned before, we do not normally offer to pay the duty, so this will be experimental and I will then
have to invoice you separately for the duty after we receive our invoice from UPS.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

On Fri, 30 Jun 2023 at 16:55, Nick Vardatsikos <nv@nivaco.gr> wrote:
Dear Ryan

Attached please find our P.O. 20211-23 for oxygen meters and cells 
Confirmation and delivery time  requested .

Thank you  and please proceed.  

Regards
Nick 

Nikolaos C. Vardatsikos
t: +30 2108069726 | m: +30 6932410902
e: nv@nivaco.gr
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w: www.nivaco.gr
a: 2 Evvias str. Marousi 15125, Greece
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