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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Ultramax query
1 message

Niall Barron <niall.barron@dolbyvivisol.com> 3 July 2023 at 15:17
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi Kate,

Sorry for the delay, please find our PO attached to proceed with the order.

Would you be able to estimate a leadtime when you can?

Thanks,
Niall

On Tue, Apr 18, 2023 at 9:49 AM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Niall,

I hope you are well.

We have received your email via Maxtec, I believe you are interested in purchasing 20 x 0111265
- UltraMaxO2 oxygen analyser.  The price is £598 each, plus £12 carriage, plus VAT.
This item would have a lead time.

If you require a proforma invoice, I would need your delivery and invoice addresses and VAT number in order to set
up a new account for you.

Please see attached price list.

Please let me know if I can be of any further assistance.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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