26/06/2023, 12:51

M Gmail

Re: Small Order - Tech Gas Asia Pte. Ltd.

1 message

Tech Gas Asia <info@techgasasia.com>
To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Cc: "arhyiu@gmail.com" <arhyiu@gmail.com>

Hi Ryan,

Gmail - Re: Small Order - Tech Gas Asia Pte. Ltd.

Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

26 June 2023 at 12:03

We need this order very urgently. Customer coming to collect the sensors this Wednesday.

Please proceed to ship out using your courier and charge to Dave’s credit card as per usual. With or without the add-on R-17VAN
sensors is okay.

Looking forward to hearing from you.

Thank you.

Dinie

On Fri, 23 Jun 2023 at 6:29 PM, TGA <info@techgasasia.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

Very sorry, can we trouble you to add in 2 pcs of the R-17VAN sensor to this shipment please?

Please assist to remove the delivery charge on the invoice as we will have to use our own shipping account.

After that please let me know the updated dimensions and weight of the parcel if there is any changes.

Thank you so much.

Dinie

Administrator

Tech Gas Asia Pte. Ltd.

On 2023-06-23 4:42 pm, Ryan Swaine wrote:

Hi Dinie
Yes, confirmed.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 23 Jun 2023 at 09:01, TGA <info@techgasasia.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan,
No worries! May | confirm that the pickup address is as below?

Vandagraph Ltd

15 Station Road

Cross Hills

Keighley, West Yorkshire
BD20 7DT, United Kingdom

Thank you.

Dinie
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On 2023-06-23 12:13 am, Ryan Swaine wrote:

Dear Dinie
| apologise for the late reply.
32x24x16cm, 1.2kg

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 21 Jun 2023 at 05:47, TGA <info@techgasasia.com> wrote:
Hi Ryan,
For accounting and tax declaration purposes, we will need to use our own courier.
Could you advise us on the dimensions and weight of the parcel?
Thank you.
Dinie
Administrator
Tech Gas Asia Pte. Ltd.
On 2023-06-20 7:45 pm, Ryan Swaine wrote:
Hi Dinie
Thank you very much for your order. Please find your proforma invoice attached.

Please let me know once you have made the payment or if there are any
amendments required.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 20 Jun 2023 at 12:13, TGA <info@techgasasia.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,

Good day to you. We would like to order the below items:

R-33VAN Sensor (x1)

R-22AT Sensor (x1)

VN202 mkll Oxygen Analyser (inc. Sensor/Quick-Ox) - Manual switch-off
(x2)

¢ Quick-Ox Sampling device (for use with VN202, TEK-OX, AD300, MD300)
(x2)

Thank you very much.
Dinie

Administrator
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Tech Gas Asia Pte. Ltd.
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