26/06/2023, 12:11 Gmail - RE: Order 23.6.23

M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: Order 23.6.23

1 message

Tzanoudakis Diving <diving@tzanoudakis.gr> 26 June 2023 at 10:46

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

All is correct, | ‘Il forward it to the accounting dpt.

Thank you

Best Regards,
Sissi Psarrou,

Administrative Assistant

Tzanoudakis Diving est 1943
Diving Equipment & Compressor Distribution

Alexandrou Papanastasiou Av. 65
Piraeus 18533, Greece

diving@tzanoudakis.gr
Tel +30 210 4118909

Fax +30 210 4119967

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Monday, June 26, 2023 11:30 AM

To: Tzanoudakis Diving <diving@tzanoudakis.gr>

Subject: Re: Order 23.6.23

Thank you Sissi

Please can you check both the invoice and address details on the proforma attached and let me know if there are any
amendments required?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
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http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 26 Jun 2023 at 07:50, Tzanoudakis Diving <diving@tzanoudakis.gr> wrote:
Hi Ryan,
you are right, thank you for noticing it.
The invoicing address is “Al.Papanastasiou 65”, the delivery address is “Al.Papanastasiou 23”

Thank you ©

Best Regards,
Sissi Psarrou,

Administrative Assistant

Tzanoudakis Diving est 1943
Diving Equipment & Compressor Distribution

Alexandrou Papanastasiou Av. 65
Piraeus 18533, Greece

diving@tzanoudakis.gr
Tel +30 210 4118909

Fax +30 210 4119967

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Friday, June 23, 2023 3:40 PM

To: Tzanoudakis Diving <diving@tzanoudakis.gr>

Subject: Re: Order 23.6.23

Hi Sissi

Is the address okay on the invoice, as it is different to the one in your email?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
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General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 23 Jun 2023 at 11:16, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Sissi

Thank you very much. Please find a copy of your proforma invoice attached.

Please let me know as soon as you have made the payment or if you have any questions.

Please have a great weekend,

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Fri, 23 Jun 2023 at 10:48, Tzanoudakis Diving <diving@tzanoudakis.gr> wrote:
Dear Ryan hi,
| would like to order the following:
- Sensor R17 VAN: 2pcs
- Sensor R22 VAN: 2pcs
- Sensor R33 DE: 1pc

Thank you

Best Regards,
Sissi Psarrou,

Administrative Assistant

Tzanoudakis Diving Est 1943
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Diving Equipment & Compressor Distribution

Alexandrou Papanastasiou Av. 65
Piraeus 18533, Greece

diving@tzanoudakis.gr
Tel +30 210 4118909
Fax +30 210 4119967
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