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You don't often get email from office@viamed.co.uk. Learn why this is important

Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

RE: Quote Request
1 message

Honeron Costa <Honeron@pacificmarinegroup.com.au> 14 June 2023 at 00:04
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,

 

Thanks for the promptly reply.

 

Let’s go forward with 2 sensor cells + Airmail.

Could you please send the proforma invoice?

 

 

Kind Regards,

 

Honeron Costa, Dive Technician

+61 0458 585 793 |    

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Tuesday, June 13, 2023 7:48 PM
To: Honeron Costa <Honeron@pacificmarinegroup.com.au>
Subject: Re: Quote Request

 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

 

Dear Honeron

 

Thank you very much for your email.

 

The R-33VAN-2 Sensors are GBP £85 each EXW

We have a couple of options for delivery:
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Airmail (international signed service) = GBP £16

UPS (express saver service) = GBP £42

 

If you need the sensors in a hurry, then I would recommend the UPS service, as airmail would typically take 2-3 weeks.

 

The sensors are assembled to order, this normally takes 7 working days from receipt of order.

 

Please let me know if you have any questions or if you would like to proceed with an order and I can send you a proforma invoice.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

Ryan Swaine

General Manager
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Mon, 12 Jun 2023 at 23:27, Honeron Costa <Honeron@pacificmarinegroup.com.au> wrote:

Hi Team,

 

Can I please have a quote for the item below + shipping to Australia.

 

02x R-33VAN-2 Oxygen Sensor (0110241)

 

Kind Regards,

 

Honeron Costa, Dive Technician

+61 0458 585 793 |    

 

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
mailto:Honeron@pacificmarinegroup.com.au
https://www.linkedin.com/company/pacific-marine-group
https://www.pacificmarinegroup.com.au/

