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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Proforma invoice
1 message

Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com> 13 June 2023 at 10:04
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi Kate

Yes, I have no problem with it, we just need to re quote in GBP distributor pricing, but there are no bank charges if we
receive pounds.

Thank you, Ryan

On Tue, 13 Jun 2023 at 09:44, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Ryan, 

AZ have asked if they can pay in £ as it will be quicker.  Before I ask Helen (she is doing goods out), are you ok
with this?  It will mean they will have an a/c on i/stats in USD, Euros and £.

Thank you.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Darine Choufany <darine@azmedicslebanon.com>
Date: Tue, 13 Jun 2023 at 09:30
Subject: RE: Proforma invoice
To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear kate,

Hope you are doing well.
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I received the PI from you, and I am trying to do the transfer, but it gav e me that if I want to pay in Pound the
transfer will take only 3 days to reach you, and if in ISD it will take 8 days to reach you.

For me I am in a bit hurry for the goods, so can I do the transfer in pound or if I did in USD and send you the
swift could you start preparing the goods so once you receive the payment you can immediately proceed the
shipment.

Kindly get back to me whaqt do you prefer.

 

 

 

Darine Choufany
CEO, AZmedics s.a.r.l

 

 

 

  +961-81-985096   +961-70-849089

  darine@azmedicslebanon.com

  Mansourieh - Aylout Street - Office Building -3151-2nd Floor

  P.O.BOX:55-600 Sin el fil , Lebanon

 

 

 

Please consider your environmental responsibility. Before printing this e-mail message, ask yourself
whether you really need a hard copy.

 

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 4:35 PM
To: darine@azmedicslebanon.com
Cc: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Subject: Proforma invoice
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Good afternoon Darine,

 

Please see attached proforma invoice relating to your PO 001-2023-PO-3.

It is valid for 30 days.  I have used the following for the delivery and invoice addresses, please let me know if you
require any changes to be made.

Many thanks.

 

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------


