06/06/2023, 14:21 Gmail - RE: Oxygen sensors

M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Oxygen sensors
1 message

farah ELDimassi <info@techno-med.org> 6 June 2023 at 11:33

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Cc: houssein ghandour <h-ghandour@hotmail.com>

Dear Kate,

We are used to the USD not GBP so preferable to be in USD .
Thank you
BR

Farah

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Tuesday, June 06, 2023 1:01 PM

To: farah ELDimassi <info@techno-med.org>

Subject: Re: Oxygen sensors

Hi Farah,

I will email you an official quotation detailing carriage charges etc as soon as | have the weights and dimensions
from a colleague. Are you happy for me to use UK £ for this quotation? Your latest order have been for USD.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f:1767847289294146526%7Cmsg-f:1767949079014390...
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E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 6 Jun 2023 at 10:08, farah ELDimassi <info@techno-med.org> wrote:

Dear Kate,

If we need two units , what would be the shipping cost value?
Thank you

Farah

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Monday, June 05, 2023 3:11 PM

To: farah ELDimassi <info@techno-med.org>

Cc: janine.qgill@viamed.co.uk

Subject: Re: Oxygen sensors

Good afternoon,

Thank you for your reply.

We can supply the T-7 oxygen sensor, part number 0110057. | have attached a technical specification document.
The price breaks are as follows:

1-24 = £ 58.90 each EXW 25 or more = £ 53.00 each EXW
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