06/06/2023, 10:28 Gmail - Re: R17 Van

M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: R17 Van

1 message

Tofo Scuba <info@tofoscuba.com> 6 June 2023 at 10:17
To: "ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hi Ryan,

Sorry for the delay, we have just paid this now.

Can you please send to:

Ritchie Hunt (Tofo Scuba)

12 helens road, sandford, north somerset, BS25 5PD
Thanks

Ross
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Facebook | Twitter | Instagram | TripAdvisor | RateYourDive
Whatsapp +258 84 373 3074

Please ensure you are physically fit for diving. If you have had surgery or any ongoing illness that may affect diving, please bring a Doctors note stating
you are fit to dive.
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: 06 June 2023 10:44

To: Tofo Scuba

Subject: Re: R17 Van

Hi Ross

| hope this email finds you well.

Please can you let me know if the attached proforma invoice is still valid?
Thank you and best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 4 May 2023 at 11:32, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk> wrote:
H Ross

| hope you're keeping well.

Please find a proforma invoice attached for the 3x R-17VAN sensors.
Please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

General Manager

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 4 May 2023 at 09:42, Tofo Scuba <info@tofoscuba.com> wrote:
Hi,

Can you please send me a quote for:

3 x R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor (0110217)
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Plus courier fee (not sure where in the UK yet)

Thanks

Ross
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Facebook | Twitter | Instagram | TripAdvisor | RateYourDive
Whatsapp +258 84 373 3074

Please ensure you are physically fit for diving. If you have had surgery or any ongoing illness that may affect diving, please bring a Doctors note
stating you are fit to dive.
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