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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: New Order
1 message

Michiel Mallie <Michiel@mallie.nl> 5 June 2023 at 13:25
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, Michiel Mallie <Michiel@mallie.nl>

Hello Kate,

 

I would like to return this sensor to investigate what the problem is that

It is not working

 

Please provide a pro forma invoice fort he delivery of 3 sensors (part number 0110017 - R-17MED )

 

Kind Regards

 

Michiel Mallie

 

 

 

Van: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Namens Kate Griffiths
Verzonden: maandag 5 juni 2023 11:48
Aan: Michiel Mallie <Michiel@mallie.nl>
Onderwerp: Re: New Order

 

Good morning Michiel,

 

Thank you for your email.

 

Your sensor is under warranty, if you would like to send it to us to replace under warranty, please let me know.  I can
then issue you with a returns reference number for you to quote on any paperwork you include.

 

The price of part number 0110017 - R-17MED is €58.80 each EXW.  If you would like to purchase these, I would
issue you with a proforma invoice.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths
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Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 5 Jun 2023 at 08:56, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Michiel Mallie <Michiel@mallie.nl>
Date: Mon, 5 Jun 2023 at 08:49
Subject: New Order
To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@viamed.co.uk>

 

Hello Zoey or a Colleague,

 

I need 3 x R-17 Sensor for my AX300

           Part number 0110017

 

Can I buy these Sensor ??
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What do I have to do to order this ?

 

Last year I also become 3 Sensor, but one of them was not working

Connected straight from the package but it does not work,

What could bet he cause, number of the soensor is s/n774098

 

Do you want to help me with that

 

Thanks in advance

 

With Regards

 

  Michiel Mallie

 

Our Company details

 

   Medische Installatie Technieken WF Mallie bv

   Handelstraat 4b

   4143 HT LEERDAM

   NETHERLANDS

   e-mail: info@mallie.nl

 

 

 

Virusvrij.www.avast.com
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