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M Gma” Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: COPY PAYMENT - MVM143749 / To.: Ms. Kate Grifftiths / From llham - SRI
RATU

1 message

helen lamb <office@viamed.co.uk> 5 June 2023 at 09:55

Reply-To: helen.lamb@viamed.co.uk
To: kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk

We have had a payment today
INWARD PAYMENT 1/AHMAT SAIFUDIN 144860 /PROFORM Inward Payment 1/AHMAT SAIFUDIN 471.65

Looks like this is his
Helen

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ilham Ade <ilham.ade1@yahoo.co.id>

Date: Mon, 5 Jun 2023 at 04:27

Subject: COPY PAYMENT - MVM143749 / To.: Ms. Kate Girifftiths / From llham - SRI RATU

To: accounts@viamed.co.uk <accounts@viamed.co.uk>, Kate Griffiths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>,
orders@viamed.co.uk <orders@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Ms.Kate Giriffiths,

Enclosed is copy payment for proforma invoice MVM143749
Please open file attached & kindly inform us if you receive it.

| hope you can help us to process the order soon.

And send the order to Singapore address and under name as below

SAMPAI EXPRESS SERVICE AGENCIES PTE LTD. (QQ.ILHAM)

NO.625 LORONG 4 TOA PAYOH, BLK A GENERAL MAGNETICS BUILDING
SINGAPORE 319519

Tel : (65) 67435051, 62586978, 62586523 Attn.Mr.Foo

May we hear from you soon. Thank you.

Regards,

llham-SRI RATU
Telp. 08888-072067
Fax. 021-58351749
WA.0813-155-06188
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----- Pesan yang Diteruskan -----

Dari: Ilham Ade <ilham.ade1@yahoo.co.id>

Kepada: office@viamed.co.uk <office@viamed.co.uk>; kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Terkirim: Rabu, 31 Mei 2023 pukul 19.45.53 WIB

Judul: Fw: RE - ORDER 02 SENSOR / To.: Ms. Kate Girifftiths / From Ilham - SRI RATU /Waiting your proforma
invoice

Dear Ms.Kate Giriffiths,

Thank for send proforma invoice.

We'll arrange send the payment by next week.
because our bank, tomorrow and Friday is National holiday

Regards,

llham-SRI RATU

Telp. 62-8888-072067

Mobile / WA 62-813155-06188

----- Pesan yang Diteruskan -----

Dari: Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>

Kepada: Ilham Ade <ilham.ade1@yahoo.co.id>

Terkirim: Rabu, 31 Mei 2023 pukul 19.13.40 WIB

Judul: Re: RE - ORDER 02 SENSOR / To.: Ms. Kate Grifftiths / From llham - SRI RATU /Waiting your proforma
invoice

Good afternoon,
Thank you for your order.

Please see attached proforma invoice as requested. | have used the addresses as follows:

Delivery Address Invoice Address

QQ llham. Sampai Express Service  SRI Ratu Co

Agencies PTE Ltd RT.002 / RW.011 NO.12
No. 625 Lorong 4 Toa Payoh Klingkit Rawa

Blk A General Magnetics Building Buaya Cengkareng

Toa Payoh Jakarta

319519 11740

Singapore Indonesia

The lead time is approximately 8-10 weeks from date of payment.
Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting hybrid working to allow sales and admin staff to work remotely and in the office. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
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Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 31 May 2023 at 09:13, helen lamb <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ilham Ade <ilham.ade1@yahoo.co.id>

Date: Wed, 31 May 2023 at 04:03

Subject: RE - ORDER 02 SENSOR / To.: Ms. Kate Girifftiths / From llham - SRI RATU /Waiting your proforma
invoice

To: info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>, accounts@viamed.co.uk <accounts@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Ms.Kate Girifftiths,

Hereby we'd like to confirm re-order below item

10pc  AUTOMOTIVE OXYGEN SENSOR R-22A
OUTPUT CONNECTOR 3 PIN MOLEX

OUTPUT VOLTAGE : 3-17 mV

Waiting for proforma invoice.

Regards,

[lham-SRI RATU

Telp. 08888-072067

Fax. 021

----- Pesan yang Diteruskan -----

Dari: Ilham Ade <ilham.ade1@yahoo.co.id>

Kepada: accounts@viamed.co.uk <accounts@yviamed.co.uk>; info@viamed.co.uk <info@viamed.co.uk>
Terkirim: Sabtu, 27 Mei 2023 pukul 08.16.29 WIB

Judul: RE - ORDER O2 SENSOR / To.: Ms. Kate Grifftiths / From llham - SRI RATU / Fw: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s)
RVM131119-1

Dear Ms.Kate Grifftiths,

Hereby we'd like to confirm re-order below item
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10pc  AUTOMOTIVE OXYGEN SENSOR R-22A
OUTPUT CONNECTOR 3 PIN MOLEX

OUTPUT VOLTAGE : 3-17 mV
Please open file attached & kindly send us for proforma invoice.

May we hear from you soon. Thank you

Regards,

llham-SRI RATU
Telp. 08888-072067
Fax. 021-58351749
WA.0813-155-06188

----- Pesan yang Diteruskan -----

Dari: ilham.ade1 <ilham.ade1@yahoo.co.id>

Kepada: "accounts@viamed.co.uk" <accounts@viamed.co.uk>
Terkirim: Rabu, 7 Juli 2021 pukul 20.45.28 WIB

Judul: RE: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM131119-1

Dear sirs,

Thank for send invoice document.
OK.Thank you.

Regards,
Ilham - Sri Ratu

Dikirim dari Galaxy saya

-------- Pesan asli --------

Dari: accounts@viamed.co.uk

Tanggal: 07/07/21 20:09 (GMT+07:00)

Ke: ilham.ade1@yahoo.co.id

Subjek: Viamed Ltd. Invoice(s) RVM131119-1

Please find attached invoice(s) from Viamed Ltd.

Should you have any queries please do not hesitate in contacting us.
accounts@yviamed.co.uk

Regards

Accounts Department
Viamed Ltd
accounts@yviamed.co.uk
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Please do not reply to this Email as it is unmonitored.
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